
��������	 ������ �		
� 

��� �
����������������������
����������
��������	��
	���
��������������

���������	�
���
��
�

��������	������� ������� !��"#$���	������������������	
 ��%�����"!��"#$���	�������#

��������


�������������������� � ������� � ���
�� � ����������� � ������ � ���
�� � ������ ��� � �������� � �!������� � ��"�!����

�������	
����

������ ���#������! ���������$#�%&%'(�
� ����%��)

�	*+,�-	.�/��$01

Repatriate  B’deshis
staying illegally:
Nizamuddin locals
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With multiple petitions
seeking surveys in

mosques, claiming they were
once temples, the Supreme
Court has constituted a
special Bench of three judges
headed by Chief Justice of
India Sanjiv Khanna to hear a
batch of petitions challenging
the constitutional validity of
the Places of Worship (Special
Provisions) Act, 1991 on
December 12 at 3.30 pm.
Justices Sanjay Kumar and
KV Viswanathan are the part
of the special Bench. 
The 1991 law prohibits
conversion of any place of
worship and provides for the
maintenance of the religious
character of any place of
worship as it existed on
August 15, 1947. The law,
however, made only one
exception -- dispute over the
Ram Janmabhoomi-Babri
Masjid in Ayodhya. The
petitions filed by many Hindu
organisations argue that the
1991 law created an “arbitrary
and irrational retrospective
cut-off date” of August 15,
1947, for maintaining the
character of the places of
worship or pilgrimage against
encroachment done by
“fundamentalist-barbaric
invaders and law-breakers”. 
The Union Government has
yet to file its counter-affidavit
in the matter, despite the
several extension times given
by the Supreme Court. On
July 11, 2023, the Court asked
the Union to file the counter
by October 31, 2023. The Sc is
already seized about six
petitions, including the PILs

filed by Bharatiya Janata Party
(BJP) leader Subramanian
Swamy and lawyer Ashwini
Upadhyay against certain
provisions of the law. 
The management committee
of, Anjuman Intezamia
Masajid, Varanasi, in its plea
filed through lawyer Fuzail
Ahmad Ayyubi, filed an
intervention application in
the top court seeking
dismissal of the pending pleas
against the 1991 law on the
ground that they were based
on “rhetorical and communal
claims” that could disrupt
communal harmony and the
rule of law. 
Upadhyay, in his PIL, sought
setting aside of Sections 2, 3, 4
of the Places of Worship
(Special Provisions) Act, 1991
on various grounds, including
that these provisions took
away the right of judicial
remedy to reclaim a place of
worship of any person or a
religious group. While Swamy
wanted the apex court to
“read down” certain
provisions to enable Hindus
to stake claim over the

Gyanvapi Mosque in Varanasi
and the Shahi Idgah Mosque
in Mathura. 
The Managing Committee of
the Gyanvapi Mosque has
filed an intervention before
the Supreme Court on Friday
on pleas challenging the
validity of the Places of
Worship Act 1991. It said that
the consequences of the
declaration sought by the
petitioner that the Act was
unconstitutional “are bound
to be drastic.” 
The mosque committee
further underscored the
potential “drastic
consequences” of overturning
the law, citing incidents like
the Sambhal case, where a
recent survey order
reportedly triggered
widespread protests and
resulted in six fatalities. The
committee warned that
repealing the Act could lead
to a surge in disputes over
religious sites across the
country, prompting tensions
in “every nook and corner”
while threatening communal
harmony.
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The Yamuna River’s water
has become so polluted
that it is no longer safe

for drinking, bathing, or even
irrigation, a shocking
revelation made by the
Central Water Commission’s
latest report, ‘Status of Trace
and Toxic Metals in Indian
Rivers’. 
The study exposes
dangerously high
concentrations of heavy
metals such as chromium,
nickel, and lead, threatening
to unleash a public health
crisis in cities like Agra and
Mathura.
According to the report, water
samples collected from three
locations in Agra, including
Poiya Ghat, and one in
Mathura revealed alarming
levels of these toxic metals.
Agra and Mathura are now
ranked among 187 worst-hit
cities nationwide, where three
or more hazardous metals
were found in river water,
earning them the grim
distinction of having the
“worst” water quality in the
country.
The data is damning. In Agra,
nickel levels touched 28.87
micrograms per liter,
chromium soared to a
staggering 135.15 micrograms
per liter, while lead reached
23.41 micrograms per liter-
several times above
permissible limits. In
Mathura, chromium was
recorded at 138.02 and 0.55
micrograms per liter at
different sites, while nickel
stood at 56.04 micrograms per
liter. Experts have warned that
prolonged exposure to such
contamination can trigger

skin diseases, ulcers, lung
damage, weakened immunity,
heart conditions, kidney
failure, liver malfunction, and
even cancer.
What makes the situation
worse is that Agra’s water
treatment facilities are
woefully unequipped to
handle such a toxic onslaught.
The city’s two major water
treatment plants, Jiwani
Mandi and Sikandra Water
Works, are still stuck with
outdated technologies that can
only test for basic parameters
like turbidity, color, pH, TDS,
hardness, coliform, and E.
coli. Heavy metal detection is
entirely outside their scope.
Sikandra’s 144 MLD MBBR
plant, which supplies water to
nearly half the city, lacks the
necessary filtration systems to
remove deadly metals. “We
currently don’t have
equipment to detect heavy

metals in Yamuna water.
Samples are tested at external
labs occasionally, but there’s
no real-time monitoring,”
admitted Arvendra Rajput,
General Manager of the
Waterworks Department.
The root cause of this toxicity
is an unchecked flow of
industrial waste into the
Yamuna. Electroplating units,
chemical factories, welding
and refining plants, foundries,
and even the automotive
industry are said to be
dumping hazardous waste
into the river with impunity.
Pollution from pesticides,
detergents, and fertilizers has
further aggravated the crisis.
Environmentalists have
slammed regulatory bodies
for failing to enforce pollution
norms. “If the Pollution
Control Board claims to have
stopped factories from
discharging waste into the

Yamuna, how are such
dangerous levels of heavy
metals still present in the
river? This report exposes the
regulatory failures and calls
for immediate corrective
action,” said Dr. Sanjay
Kulshreshtha, an
environmental expert.
Echoing similar concerns,
environmentalist Shachindra
Sharma issued a stark
warning: “The toxic state of
the Yamuna River is a ticking
time bomb for both public
health and the environment.
Strict regulations and
immediate steps are essential
to prevent irreversible
damage.”
With the specter of a full-
blown environmental disaster
looming large, experts are
urging swift government
action before the Yamuna
turns into an irreversible toxic
nightmare.
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Amid the killing of Hindus
in Bangladesh, a

delegation of prominent
Ulemas and residents of the
Hazrat Nizamuddin Dargah
and Basti Hazrat Nizamuddin
area met with Lieutenant
Governor Vinai Kumar
Saxena on Saturday and
demanded a special drive to
identify and repatriate
Bangladeshis staying illegally
in the city. The delegation
further demanded that
Bangladeshi people should
not be given employment by
any establishment and those
who have given employment
to them should remove them. 
Meanwhile, sources in the
Delhi police said there is not
much information about the
exact number of
Bangladeshis in Delhi. In a
statement, the Lieutenant
Governor’s office said,
reiterating that they were
worried about the situation of
their Hindu brethren and
other minorities in
Bangladesh and worsening
state-of-affairs in the country,
the delegation demanded
stringent action against
Bangladesh nationals illegally
staying in Delhi. In a letter
submitted to Saxena, the
delegation said they should
not be provided rented
accommodation or jobs in
any establishment.
According to the statement,
the delegation demanded
that illegal Bangladeshi
infiltrators should not be
given houses on rent and
those houses who have
already rented out their
premises should evict them.
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The United States Embassy
on Saturday rejected the

Bharatiya Janata Party’s
allegations that organisations
funded by the US State
Department, and elements in
the American “deep state”
were behind attempts to
destabilise India through
targeted attacks on Prime
Minister Narendra Modi, and
business tycoon Gautam
Adani. A spokesperson at the
US embassy described the
allegations as “disappointing”
and asserted that the US
government has been a
champion of media freedom
around the world. 

The BJP had alleged on
Thursday that the US deep
state colluded with the media
portal OCCRP (Organised
Crime and Corruption
Reporting Project) and
Congress leader Rahul Gandhi
to “damage” India’s image. The
BJP had cited Gandhi’s use of
reports by OCCRP to attack
the Adani Group and to accuse
it of having closeness with the
government. “It’s
disappointing that the ruling
party in India would make
these kinds of accusations,” the
US embassy spokesperson
said.
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Two murders in different
colonies rocked Delhi on

Saturday, with the ruling Aam
Aadmi Party (AAP)
government blasting the
Centre over the law and order
situation in the National
Capital. A 52-year-old
businessman was shot dead
by two unidentified assailants
during his morning walk in
Shahdara while a man was
stabbed to death during a
brawl in South Delhi’s
Govindpuri. The brazen
killings and increased
criminal activities have raised
concerns about public safety
and the efficacy of law
enforcement in Delhi.
Reacting to the two incidents,
AAP national convenor
Arvind Kejriwal said that
criminals have become
“fearless” under the BJP rule.
“After the firing in Vishwas
Nagar, now news of stabbing
is coming from Govindpuri.
Under the BJP rule, criminals
have become completely
fearless,” he wrote on X.

These latest crimes are sure to
result in a major slugfest
between the Centre and other
political parties over the
increasing lawlessness as the
Delhi Police and law and
order in the national Capital
come under the jurisdiction
of the Union Home Ministry.
The The AAP is going to
make law and order an
electoral issue when Delhi
holds Assembly polls in
February.
In Shahdara, at least eight
rounds were fired at the
victim, identified as Sunil
Jain, near the Yamuna Sports
complex. Jain who ran a
business of utensils, was
returning home on a scooty,
when two motorcycle-borne
unidentified attackers opened
fire at him in the Farsh Bazar
area.
Shahdara Deputy
Commissioner of Police
Prashant Gautam confirmed
that the police received a PCR
call at 8.36 am, and at least
seven bullets were fired at Jain
after which the accused fled
the scene. 
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The International Society
for Krishna Consciousness

(ISKCON) on Saturday alleged
that its centre in Dhaka district
in neighbouring Bangladesh
was burnt down earlier in the
day. Iskcon Kolkata vice
president Radharamn Das told
PTI that the targetted attack
on members of the
community and members of
the Vaishnavite order goes on
unabated as “vandals set
ablaze idols inside the temple
at the Namhatta property.”
He said in a post on X handle,
“ISKCON Namhatta Centre
burned down in Bangladesh.
The deities of Sri Sri Laxmi
Narayan and all items inside
the temple were burned down
completely The centre is
located in Dhaka. Early
morning today, between 2-3
AM, miscreants set fire to the
Shri Shri Radha Krishna
Temple and the Shri Shri
Mahabhagya Lakshmi
Narayan Temple, which fall
under the Hare Krishna
Namhatta Sangha, located in

Dhour village, under the
jurisdiction of Turag Police
Station, Dhaka district. The
fire was initiated by lifting the
tin roof at the back of the
temple and using petrol or
octane. Address: H-02, R-05,
Ward-54,” he said in the post.
Das claimed that attacks are
continuing and despite the
ISKCON drawing the
attention of the interim
government in Bangladesh,
not much is being done by the
police and administration to
assuage their grievances and
address their concern. “Iskcon
India has expressed concern
about the safety of Hindus in
Bangladesh and urged its
monks and followers from
Bangladesh not to wear ‘tilaks’
and practice their faith
discreetly. The targeted
attacks continue,” he had
earlier said.
The Iskcon Kolkata vice
president also expressed
concern over arrested Hindu
community leader Chinmoy
Krishna Das’s safety following
his denial of bail and the
violent attacks.
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India co-sponsored a UN
General Assembly draft

resolution that was
unanimously adopted to
proclaim December 21 as
World Meditation Day. India,
including Liechtenstein, Sri
Lanka, Nepal, Mexico and
Andorra, was a member of the
core group of countries that
guided the unanimous
adoption of the resolution
titled ‘World Meditation Day’
in the 193-member UN
General Assembly on Friday.
“A day for comprehensive
well-being and inner
transformation! Glad that
India along with other nations
of the core group guided the
unanimous adoption of the
resolution on the declaration
of December 21 as World
Meditation Day @UN General
Assembly today (Friday),”
India’s Permanent
Representative to the UN
Ambassador Parvathaneni
Harish said in a post on X.
He said India’s leadership in

overall human wellbeing
stems from “our civilisational
dictum of
#VasudhaivaKutumbakam -
the whole world is one family”.
Harish noted that December
21 marks the Winter Solstice,
which in Indian tradition is
the beginning of “Uttarayana -
an auspicious time of the year,
especially for inner reflection”
and meditation. It also falls
exactly six months after the
International Day of Yoga
commemorated on June 21,
which is the Summer Solstice.
Recalling that India had in
2014 taken the lead in
declaring June 21 as
International Day of Yoga,
Harish said that in a decade, it
has become a global
movement which has led to
common people across the
globe practising yoga and
making it part of their daily
lives. 
A press release by the
Permanent Mission of India to
the UN said India’s
instrumental role in the
adoption of the resolution on

World Meditation Day was a
“testimony to its firm
commitment to overall
human wellness and global
leadership on this front in
tune with our civilisational
dictum of Vasudhaiva
Kutumbakam”. The
declaration of World
Meditation Day comes at a
time when various regions of
the globe witness conflicts and
growing tensions, the mission
said.
It underlined that meditation
is rooted in ancient practises
and is an effective tool to
achieve inner transformation
and peace in the modern day.
It is aimed at comprehensive
human well-being, including
mental, emotional, physical
and spiritual dimensions. It
prepares human beings to
cope with several modern-
day issues such as heightened
anxiety and stress and brings
about harmony between
mind and body, humans and
nature.
“Modern science attests to the
numerous benefits of
meditation and its profound
impact on our lives. It has
been scientifically proven that
regular meditation
significantly reduces stress,
and enhances cognitive and
physical functions,” the Indian
mission added.
The resolution, introduced by
Liechtenstein, was also
cosponsored by Bangladesh,
Bulgaria, Burundi, the
Dominican Republic, Iceland,
Luxembourg, Mauritius,
Monaco, Mongolia, Morocco,
Portugal and Slovenia.

Special SC Bench to hear validity of
Places of Worship (Special Provisions) Act
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Yamuna grows toxic veggies?

ISKCON centre in Bangladesh
burnt down: Radharaman Das

December 21 is World Meditation Day, UNGA
adopts resolution co-sponsored by India
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Two murders in a day, AAP
raises law and order issue
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The stage was set and the
wedding party was ready

to bring home the beautiful
bride chosen by their Dubai-
returned groom. The
wedding had been planned
online and this was the first
time everyone, including the
groom, would be meeting
the lawyer-bride, or so they
thought. 
However, Deepak Kumar
(24) and his entourage of
150 ‘baraatis’ were shocked
when they arrived in Moga,
Punjab, only to find his

bride “missing”, adding
insult to injury they also
realised that the wedding
venue did not exist. A month
ago returned from Dubai to
Jalandhar, Punjab to marry
one Manpreet Kaur. Kumar
had been talking to her via
Instagram for three years,
but had never met her in
person, the police said. After
realising he had been duped,
Kumar lodged a police
complaint against Kaur
Kumar told the police that
he along with his family had
travelled all the way from
Mandiali village in
Jalandhar to Moga for the

wedding at the venue that
had been chosen by the
bride and her family. Upon
reaching Moga, the bride’s
family reportedly told
Kumar that some people will
escort him and his family to
the wedding venue.
However, even after waiting
till 5 pm, no one showed up,
Kumar said.
He added that they had
asked the locals about the
wedding venue named ‘Rose
Garden Palace’ but were told
that there was no such place
in Moga. The groom said
that he worked as a labourer
in Dubai and had been in

touch with Kaur through 
the platform Instagram for
the past three years. Kumar
said he had seen Kaur’s
photos but never met her in
person. Their parents had
arranged the wedding 
over phone calls, police
officials said, adding that
Kumar also claimed to have
transferred Rs 50,000 to
Kaur earlier. 
His father Prem Chand said
that 150 ‘baraatis’ came for
the wedding, and that he had
already hired taxis, paid for
catering and a videographer.
Kaur reportedly hails from
Moga and had earlier told

Kumar that she works in
Ferozepur, he said. The
groom’s father said that the
marriage was fixed after
speaking to Kaur’s parents
over the phone, and guests
were invited for the
wedding.
Meanwhile, Moga Assistant
Sub-Inspector Harjinder
Singh said they have
received a complaint from
Deepak Kumar. Singh said
the complaint was lodged
after the groom’s family
could not reach the bride as
her phone was switched off.
Further investigation in the
matter is underway, he said.

US denies backing
anti-India agenda
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I, Sajna Wd/o Late Parveen 

Kumar R/o # C-52, GHS, 92, 

Sector- 20, Panchkula. My son 

Abhishek Kumar is out of my 

control, So disowned him from my 

all moveable/ Immoveable 

Properties. Anybody dealing with 

him, will deal at his/ her own Risk. 

I, Kamlesh W/o Late Sh. 

Satyawan Singh R/o H.No. 

51F/19, Shiv Mandir Wali Gali, 

Patel Nagar, Sonipat has 

disowned my son Vikas & his wife 

Pooja from my all movable-

immovable property as they are 

out of my control. In future, if 

anybody deals with them, he/she 

will do at their own risk. 

We  Ramesh Chand  S/o Sh. 

Pritam Singh & Surinder Kaur W/o 

Ramesh Chand  R/o Village 

Baknaur Tehsil & Distt  Ambala  

inform that our Son Gurwinder 

Singh & his wife Inderpreet Kaur 

are out of our control. So we 

disown both of them  from our 

moveable /immovable properties. 

We and our family members will 

not be responsible for any kind of 

transaction or legal or illegal work 

done by them. 

I Paramjeet Singh (Aadhaar 

No. 204328678645) S/o Sh. Trilok 

Singh & Gurmeet Kaur W/o Sh. 

Paramjeet Singh R/o H.No. 413, 

Street No. 3, Hansi Road Karnal 

have declared that my son Prince 

Madaan and daughter-in-law 

Sonali Madaan both are out of my 

control. Therefore we disown both 

of them from our movable and 

immovable property. In future, the 

person who deals with both of 

them will be responsible himself. I 

and other members of my family 

will not have any responsibility. 

I, Pushpa Devi, W/o late. 

Mulkh Raj, Resident of backside 

of Kartar Palace, Sarna Tehsil & 

District Pathankot, Declare That 

My Son Rishu Kumar and His 

Wife Smt. Rishu Kumari is Out of 

My Control, So I Disinherit them 

My Movable and immovable 

property, anybody Dealing with 

them Shell be Responsible 

himself. Kindly Note. 

I, Hans Raj S/o Shri Devi 

Das R/o House No. 646, Ward 

No. 12, Jundla Gate, Karnal, That 

my son Harish Kumar & his wife 

Preeti is out of my Control. That's 

why I disown him from my 

movable and immovable property. 

In future, the person who deals 

with it himself will be responsible. 

I and my other family members 

and relatives will not have any 

responsibility. 

I Vijay Kumar S/o Late Sh. 

Ram Ratan Goyal R/o House No. 

647-A/33 Vishwakarma Nagar, 

Kathmandi, Rohtak declare that 

my son Neeraj Goyal and 

daughter-in-law Sakshi wife of 

Neeraj Goyal are beyond my 

control. I evict both of them from 

my movable and immovable 

property. I and my family have 

nothing to do with them. In future, 

Neeraj Goyal and Sakshi will 

themselves be responsible for 

their transactions and other 

works. 

I, Bimla W/o Late Sh. Sanjay 

Kumar R/o Village Nigana, Teh. 

Kalanaur, Distt. Rohtak declare 

that my daughter Sheetal is out of 

my control. So I disown her from 

my all moveable/immoveable 

properties. Any body dealing with 

her at their own risk. I or my family 

are not responsible for any type of 

their any acts. 

I, Balkesh Devi W/o Sh. 

Naresh Kumar R/o Village 

Makrauli Khurd (75), P.O. 

Makrauli Kalan, Distt. Rohtak 

declare that my daughter Nidhi is 

out of my control. So I disown her 

from my all moveable/ 

immoveable properties. Any body 

dealing with her at their own risk. 

I or my family are not responsible 

for any type of their any acts. 

I, Shashi Chopra W/O Vinod 

Kumar R/O H.No.-314/2, Ward 

No.4, Mohalla Karam Singh, 

Tehsil/Distt- Pathankot. Presently 

R/O New Shastri Nagar, Near 

Bharti Kiryana Store,Pathankot. 

Declare That My Son Munish And 

His Wife Nancy Chopra Are Not In 

My And My Family Saying Out Of 

Control. So I Disinherit Them 

From My Moveable And 

Immoveable Property. I Shall Not  

Be Responisble. 

I, Vinod Kumar S/O Kishan 

Dayal R/O H.No.-314/2, Ward 

No.4, Mohalla Karam Singh, 

Tehsil/Distt- Pathankot. Presently 

R/O New Shastri Nagar, Near 

Bharti Kiryana Store, Pathankot. 

Declare That My Son Munish And 

His Wife Nancy Chopra Are Not In 

My And My Family Saying Out Of 

Control. So I Disinherit Them 

From My Moveable And 

Immoveable Property. I Shall Not  

Be Responisble. 

I, Om Prakash S/o Sh. 

Badan Singh R/o H No. 859 

Housing Board Colony Jind Teh. 

& Distt. Jind (Hr.) declare that my 

son Mandeep is out of my control. 

So, I disown him from my 

movable or immovable properties. 

If Anybody dealing with him will do 

so at their own risk, I am and my 

family members not responsible. 

I, Mange Ram S/o Sardara 

Singh R/o Tundli, PO Kalarheri, 

Distt Ambala declare that my 

daughter Khushpreet Kaur's 

school record my name wrongly 

entered Manga Ram where as it 

is Mange Ram. Please 

concerned note. 

I No. 15336815X, Rank Hav 

Name Ajay Kumar Pal S/o 

Devansh Pal R/o House No. 166, 

Wadhawa Nagar, Dhakoli, 

Zirakpur, SAS Nagar Punjab 

declare that my mother’s name 

Sumaro Devi & date of birth 

02.07.1959 is written incorrect in 

my Army Record. Her correct 

name is Somaro Devi & correct 

date of birth is 01.01.1958. 

Concern Please Note. 

I No. 15336815X, Rank Hav, 

Name Ajay Kumar Pal S/o 

Devansh Pal R/o House No. 166, 

Wadhawa Nagar, Dhakoli, 

Zirakpur, SAS Nagar Punjab 

declare that my father’s name 

Deo Bansh Pal & date of birth 

01.07.1954 is written incorrect in 

my Army Record. His correct 

name is Dev Bansh Pal & correct 

date of Birth is 08.02.1955. 

Concern Please Note. 

I, Ravinder Kaur Spouse of 

JC-812350A Sub Labhjit Singh 

R/O village Fattuwal PO 

Khalchian tehsil Baba Bakala 

Sahib district Amritsar  declare 

that in my husband 's service 

documents my DOB is wrongly 

written as 12/6/1982 instead of 

01/06/1975 . My correct  DOB is 

01/06/1975. Please note. 

I Suman K. C. S/o Ran 

Bahadur K C  R/o House no 602, 

Sector 16- D Chandigarh have 

changed my name from Suman 

K C  to Suman Khatri  Chhetri. 

I  Suman Khatri  Chhetri 

S/o Ran Bahadur K C  R/o 

House no 602, Sector 16- D 

Chandigarh have changed my 

minor Son name from Sachin  to 

Sachin Khatri  Chhetri. 

I Parvati K. C. W/o Suman 

Khatri  Chhetri  R/o House no 

602, Sector 16- D Chandigarh 

have changed my  name from 

Parvati  K  C   to Parvati  Khatri  

Chhetri. 

I Naveen  K C  S/o Suman 

Khatri  Chhetri  R/o House no 

602, Sector 16- D Chandigarh 

have changed my  name from 

Naveen  K  C   to Naveen  Khatri  

Chhetri. 

I, Shallu Burt W/o Vijay 

Kumar R/o H.No.1105, Ward 

No.9, Prem Nagar, Bohranwal 

Batala, Distt. Gurdaspur declare 

that  I have changed my name 

from Shallu Burt to Shallu. 

Concerned Note. 

I, Balvir Kaur W/o Jaswant 

Singh R/o VPO Dadupur Garoya, 

Sub- Tehsil Sham Chaurasi Distt. 

Hoshiarpur Punjab have 

changed my name from Balwir 

Kaur to Balvir Kaur. Concerned 

note. 

I, Jaswant Singh S/o 

Gurbachan Singh R/o VPO 

Dadupur Garoya, Sub- Tehsil 

Sham Chaurasi Distt. Hoshiarpur 

Punjab have changed my name 

from Jassa Alias Jaswant Singh 

to Jaswant Singh. Concerned 

note. 

I, Lalit kumar S/o Rattan 

Singh R/o vill. bhatauli(405) 

Jagadhri,Yamuna Nagar have 

changed my name from Labh 

Singh to Lalit kumar. 

I, Suraj Kumar S/o Raj 

Kumar R/o 39, Bank Colony, 

Kansapur, Yamuna Nagar have 

changed my name from Suraj to 

Suraj Kumar. In future I shall be 

known as Suraj Kumar. 

I, Ranbir Singh S/o Harjit 

Singh R/o VPO Bhandal Tehsil 

Kalanour Distt Gurdaspur 

(Punjab) have changed my name 

from Ranbir Singh to Singh 

Ranbir. In future Singh is my 

Surname and Ranbir is my given 

name. Concerned note. 

I, Akshu D/o Late Vijay 

Kumar R/o Ward No.1, Katju 

Nagar, Taraori, Tehsil-Nilokheri, 

District-Karnal declare that Late 

Vijay Kumar, Late Vijay Kamra 

and Late Vijay Kumar Kamra all 

three are my father name. 

I, Shiri Ram alias Siri Ram 

alias Shri Ram S/o Hukmi Ram 

R/o House no. 381/2, Sector 40-

A, Chandigarh declare that Shiri 

Ram alias Siri Ram alias Shri 

Ram all three names belong to 

one and same person, and in 

future it will continue with same 

names. 

I, Manoj S/o Kuldeep Chand 

R/o House No. 1/4 Tipra Colony 

near Vivek Medicos Kalka, Tehsil 

Kalka, Distt. Panchkula, 

Haryana, have changed my 

name to Manoj Kumar. 

I, Sangeeta Devi W/o 

Mritunjay Singh R/o Chhotki 

Basili, PO-Badki Basoli, District-

Buxar. In my husband's service 

record my name is Sangeeta 

Devi. Which is incorrect. Correct 

name is Sangita Devi. 

I Ashna  D/O. Anupam Dua 

R/O. #1051, Sector 46-B, 

Chandigarh.  I Have Changed 

My Name From Ashna To Ashna 

Dua. 

I Vinita Sharma W/O Vijay 

Kumar, R/O # 935, Friends 

Colony, Model Town, Ambala 

City, Ambala, Haryana 134003 

Have Changed My Name From 

Vinita Sharma To Babita Sharma 

I Vipin Gupta S/o Sh. Jai 

Bhagwaan Gupta R/o H.No. A-4, 

Gali No. 4, Rajiv Puram, 

Phoosgarh Road, Karnal have 

changed my name from Vipin to 

Vipin Gupta. In future I should be 

known as Vipin Gupta. 

I Ruby W/o Bhuvnesh 

Sharma R/o #House No-7, Ward 

No-1, Near Khera Mandir Village 

Khera Sita Ram, Kalka Panchkula 

Haryana have changed my name 

to Ruby Sharma. 

I, Maya Devi D/o Mata 

Parsad W/o Arun Pal # 1079, 

Kishangarh, Chandigarh have 

changed my name to Seema after 

marriage. 

I Anjali wife of Amrish, r/o 

153/1 Gur Mandi Gandhinagar 

Tehsil Samalkha, District Panipat. 

In some documents my name is 

Anjali Mittal and Anjali. Both are 

names of the same person. 

I, Lakshay S/o Virender 

Singh R/o VPO Dhigana, District 

& Teh. Jind, Haryana-126114 

declare that the name of my father 

has been wrongly written as 

Virender in my CBSE Class 10th 

Marksheet. The actual name of 

my father is Virender Singh. 

I Sunita Arora W/o Sh. 

Gulshan Kumar, H. No. 1711/24, 

Shivam Enclave, Rohtak-124001 

Haryana declare that I have 

changed my name from Sunita 

Arora to Sunita Sachdev. In future 

I will be called as Sunita Sachdev 

for all purposes. 

I, Harmeet Singh Son of 

Jeet Singh residing at 

H.No.S17/615, 2408, Chowk 

Baba Bhouri Wala, District 

Amritsar-143001 Punjab have 

changed the name of my minor 

Daughter Gurnoor Kaur Aged 15 

Years and She Shall hereafter be 

known as Ekas Arora 

I, hitherto Known as Baljinder 

Kaur Wife of Jaswant Singh 

residing at VPO Khaper Kheri, 

Tehsil and District Amritsar-

143105 Punjab have changed my 

name and Shall hereafter be 

known as Dawinder Kaur. 

I, Amrik Singh S/o Daulat 

Ram R/o 2448, New Gopal Nagar 

Amritsar have declare that Amrik 

is my Give name and Singh is my 

Surname. 

I, Ashu S/o Kammu R/o 

Ramnagar Nat Koloni, 

Dhundhara, Jodhpur, Dunara, 

Rajasthan, 342801 now residing 

at  H. No. 42, Village Gangwa, 

Distt. Hisar (Haryana) declare that 

I have changed my name from  

Ashu to Sourav  for all future 

purposes. 

I, Kavita W/o Sh. Manoj 

Kumar R/o H. No. 662/9, 

Ramayan Mohalla, Delhi Gate, 

Hansi, Distt. Hisar (Haryana) 

declare that I have changed my 

name from Kavita  to  Kavita  Goel  

for all future purposes. 

I, Manoj Kumar Goel S/o Sh. 

Kailash Chander R/o H. No. 

662/9, Ramayan Mohalla, Delhi 

Gate, Hansi, Distt. Hisar 

(Haryana) declare that I have 

changed my name from  Manoj 

Kumar Goel  to  Manoj  Kumar  for 

all future purposes. 

I, Renu Goyal W/o Sh. 

Manoj Kumar R/o Shop No. 75, 

New Anaj Mandi, Hansi, Distt. 

Hisar (Haryana) declare that I 

have changed my name from  

Renu Goyal to  Renu  for all future 

purposes. 

I, Gargi D/o Sh. Manoj Goyal 

R/o Shop No. 75, New Anaj 

Mandi, Hansi, Distt. Hisar 

(Haryana) declare that I have 

changed my name from  Gargi to  

Gargi Goyal  for all future 

purposes. 

I, Manoj alias Manoj Kumar 

S/o Sh. Rajender  Kumar  R/o 

Shop No. 75, New Anaj Mandi, 

Hansi, Distt. Hisar (Haryana) 

declare that I have changed my 

name from  Manoj alias Manoj 

Kumar to  Manoj  Goyal  for all 

future purposes. 

I Sukhpal Singh son of Desh 

Raj resident of Village Fatehpur 

Jattan Tehsil Derabassi District 

Mohali have changed my name 

from Sukhpal singh to Satpal 

Singh. 

I, Parul Kurera W/o Shri 

Uma Shankar Taneja.R/o House 

No. 1038 Sector- 17 Panchkula 

Haryana 134109, have changed 

my name from Parul Kurera to 

Parul Shankar Taneja. 

I Kanika Mehta D/o Subash 

Mehta r/ o Guru Angad Dev 

Nagar, Gali No. 4/ b, Sri Muktsar 

Sahib Have Changed my Name 

after marriage to Kanika Chhabra 

w/o Rahul Chhabra All concern 

note it 

I, Naman Chopra S/o 

Krishan Gopal Chopra R/o H. No. 

186, 22 Acre, Barnala, Punjab 

declare that my father’s name 

mentioned incorrect as Krishan 

Gopal in my Passport. His correct 

name is Krishan Gopal Chopra. 

Concern Please Note. 

I, Naman Chopra S/o 

Krishan Gopal Chopra R/o H. No. 

186, 22 Acre, Barnala, Punjab 

declare that my mother’s name 

mentioned incorrect as Monika in 

my Passport. Her correct name is 

Monika Chopra. Concern Please 

Note. 

I, Roshani Devi, w/o Balraj, 

r/o Badsui, Tehsil Guhla, District 

Kaithal, Haryana hereby declare 

that I have changed my name 

from Roshani Devi to Roshani. 

I, Kavita Devi W/o No. 

10315857-F Hav Rajkumar R/o 

Village Farmana Khas, Teh. 

Meham, Distt. Rohtak (Haryana) 

declare that my DOB 15.07.1977 

are wrongly mentioned in my 

husband Army Service record. But 

my correct & actual DOB is 

04.01.1982. vide affidavit dated 

07.12.2024 before Notary Public 

Rohtak. 

I, Balraj Singh, s/o Telu Ram 

r/o Badsui, Tehsil Guhla, District 

Kaithal, Haryana hereby declare 

that I have changed my name 

from Balraj Singh to Balraj. 

I, Pritam Singh S/o Munshi 

Ram R/o #2122, Urban Estate, 

Near Jaat Dharamshala JIND-

126102 (Haryana) I have 

declared that my name changed 

from Pritam Singh To Pritam 

Singh Beniwal. 

I, Amir Khan, son of 

Ramesh, resident of village 

Lohari Jatu, Tehsil Bawani Khera, 

District Bhiwani, hereby state with 

my affidavit that in my PAN card, 

my father's name has been 

wrongly written as Alisher, 

whereas my father's name is 

Ramesh. For all future purpose 

I,  Krishna Devi Malhan W/o 

Pritam Singh Beniwal  R/o #2122, 

Urban Estate, Near Jaat 

Dharamshala JIND-126102 

(Haryana) I have declared that 

my name changed from Krishna 

Devi Malhan To Krishna Devi 

Beniwal. 

I Shiv Charan s/o Som 

Parkash, Aaryan s/o Shiv Charan 

R/o Vill. Saran449, Distt. Yamuna 

Nagar(Haryana) have changed 

my minor son name from Aaryan 

to Aaryan Paul. 

I, Manu Spouse of 

JC.674936P Sub/MT-Rajusingh 

Resident of House-No-65, 

Mohala-Shri Ram Dhamcolony, 

Village-Aurangabad, Post- 

Alurangabad, Tehsil-Mathura, 

Distt-Mathura (UP) have changed 

my name from Manu to Manu 

Devi Affidavit No.2418, Date-06-

12-2024, Before SDM Court 

Kalka. 

I, Sarabjeet Kaur W/O. Tara 

Singh Panesar R/O. 69 A, Hardev 

Nagar, Kapurthala Road, 

Jalandhar Have Changed My 

Name To Sarabjeet Kaur 

Panesar. Please Note. 

I, Amit Sharma S/o Suraj 

Bhan R/o H.No. 1550, Moti 

Nagar, Near Railway Station, 

Hisar (Haryana) have changed 

my name from Amit Kumar to 

Amit Sharma for all purposes in 

future. 

I, Pooja Sharma W/o Amit 

Sharma  R/o H.No. 1550, Moti 

Nagar, Near Railway Station, 

Hisar (Haryana) have changed 

my name from Pooja to Pooja 

Sharma for all purposes in future. 

I, Gurinder  Singh   S/o  

Sukhdev  Singh  R/o VPO Vallah 

Near Gurudwara baba Jivan 

Singh  Mehta Road Amritsar have 

Changed my name to Gurinder is 

my given name and Singh is my 

surname 

I Malkiat Singh son of Sh 

Assa Singh resident of Vill - Nawa 

Pind, Post - Bal Bawa, Tehsil - 

Ajnala, Dist - Amritsar, Punjab - 

143606  has changed the name 

of my mother from Sarjit Kaur to 

Surjit Kaur in my Army Record 

vide affidavit at Amritsar on 

06/12/2024. 

I, Navpreet Singh son of 

Amarjeet Singh  R/o 181, Patti 

Zaildara Di,  Verka, Amritsar-

143501,  I have changed my 

name to Navpreet is my given 

name and Singh is my surname. 

I, Rajinder kaur  W/o  Dilbag 

Singh  village lopoke, tehsil 

lopoke, district Amritsar,   I have 

changed my name  from  Rajinder 

kaur to Daljit kaur. concerned 

notes. 

I, Naminder Kaur  W/o 

Sardara Singh   R/o H no. 347 Vill 

Ball PO Bal Purian Tehsil Batata, 

Gurdaspur have changed my 

name to Navinder Kaur 

I, Sangita W/O Umesh 

Kumar , R/O. Daya Nand Nagar, 

F.G.C  Road, Nangli Bhatha, Gali 

Bhidhi Halwai, Amritsar, Punjab 

143001 I Have Changed My 

Name Sangeeta. 

I Julfkar Ali S/o  Abdul 

Sattar R/o Village Tapu Kamalpur, 

P.O Kalanaur, Tehsil Jagadhri, 

District Yamuna Nagar. that  I 

have changed my father name 

from Abdul Sitar to Abdul Sattar. 

I, Parvej S/o Sarfraj R/o # 

Kami Majra Raipur (145) PO 

Shadipur Yamuna Nagar Tehsil 

Jagadhri Distt. Yamuna Nagar 

(Haryana)That I have change my 

name from Parvej to Mohd. 

Parvej. 

I, Sub Ganesh Prasad 

Sonkar serving in 4 Guards (1 

Rajput)  have changed my name 

from Ganesh Prasad Sonaker to 

Ganesh Prasad Sonkar. 

I, Happy  Surname Kumar 

S/o Lal Chand, Vpo Gumthala 

Garhu Tehsil  Pehowa, 

Kurukshetra, have changed the  

Name Happy Surname Kumar to 

Given Name  Happy Kumar 

I Manish Gautam S/o 

Surinder Gautam R/o House No 

20/74, Near Pancmukhi Mandir , 

Malerian Street Nabha (Patiala) 

have changed my name to 

Munish Gautam. 

I Ramanjeet Kaur W/o 

Munish Gautam R/o House No 

20/74, Near Pancmukhi Mandir , 

Malerian Street Nabha (Patiala) 

have changed my name to 

Ramanjeet Kaur Gautam. 

I, Jitendra Kumar Singh is 

Legally Father of Army No 

14686228L Rank Hav, Name: 

VIKash Kumar Singh Unit 1852 

Field Regiment C/o 56 Apo have 

changed my Name Form Jitendra 

Kumar Singh to my correct Name 

Jitendra Singh 

I, Sukhvinder Singh s/o 

Sh. Kaur Singh, r/o House No 

649, First Floor, Sector 20 A, 

Chandigarh, have changed my 

minor son’s name from Ishaan 

Kainth to Ishaan Singh. 

I Surender Kumar S/O 

Mohinder Singh Father Of 

Lakshay R/O 647 Village  

Manawali  Post Office Munawali 

Tehsil Fatehabad, District 

Fatehabad, Haryana 125050 

Have Changed My Minor Son 

Name From Lakshay To 

Goutam. 

I, Ranjit Verma S/O Om 

Parkash Verma R/O Ward No.1 

Jail Road Opp Ravi Dass 

Mandir Gurdaspur. Tehsil/Distt- 

Gurdaspur, Punjab-143521, 

India Have Changed My Name 

From Ranjit Verma To Ranjit 

Kumar Verma. 

I, Kumud S/O Amit Kumar 

R/O Village- Saidowal Kalan, 

Distt- Gurdaspur, Pin-143530, 

Punjab, India. Have Changed 

My Name From Kumud To 

Kumud Kashyap. 

I, Brijesh Yadav resident of 

Village- Sheraligarh, Post- Post- 

Bahariyabad, Tehsil- Jakhanian, 

District- Ghazipur, State- UP, 

Pin-275204, have changed my 

Mother name from Soniya to 

Sona Devi Vide affidavit No.IN-

PB86404934642717W dated 06 

Dec 2024 before notary public 

Pathankot 

I, No.4000659F Sep 

Naresh Kumar resident of 

Village- Bhagotla, Tehsil- 

Palampur, District- Kangra, 

State- HP,  have changed my 

Daughter name from Maanvi 

Bhatt to Manvi Bhatt Vide 

affidavit No.IN-

HP32663942355077W dated 07 

Dec 2024 before Executive 

Magistrate Palampur (HP) 

I, Tara Bai Chavra Mother 

of No.15622525N NK Mahesh 

Chavra resident of Village- 

Sabakheda, Post- Sabakheda, 

Tehsil- Mandasor, District- 

Mandasor, State- MP, Pin-

458002, have changed my 

name from Tara Bai Chavra to 

Tara Bai Chawda Vide affidavit 

No.IN-PB82342585878055W 

dated 25 Nov 2024 before 

notary public Pathankot 

I, Ghanshyam Chavra 

Father of No.15622525N NK 

Mahesh Chavra resident of 

Village- Sabakheda, Post- 

Sabakheda, Tehsil- Mandasor, 

District- Mandasor, State- MP, 

Pin-458002, have changed my 

name from Ghanshyam Chavra 

to Ghanshyam Chavda Vide 

affidavit No.IN-

PB82596714822547W dated 25 

Nov 2024 before notary public 

Pathankot 

I, Golab Basumatary Father 

of No.15623850A NK Akhil 

Basumatary resident of Village-  

Khansai Para, Post- Nimua, 

Tehsil- Gobardhana, District- 

Baksa, State- Assam, Pin-

781315, have changed my name 

from Golab Basumatary to Golap 

Basumatary Vide affidavit No.IN-

PB81881857056275W dated 22 

Nov 2024 before notary public 

Pathankot 

I, No. 14832755H Rank- 

NK(DVRMT) Name: G Jaya 

Prasad Service by occupation 

resident 5009 COY ASC 

(COMPO) C/o 56 APO and 

permanent resident of Vill- 

Diguva Kaminayani palle Post-Y 

S GATE Distt- Chittoor State- 

Andhra Pradesh Pin 517130 

declare that I have changed my 

wife name from K Parimala to 

Parimala Kamatham.Vide 

Affidavit No- HF 0018745334, 

Dated: 09 Sep 2024 

I, Sonia Gandhi D/o Sh. 

Muniraj is legally wedded spouse 

of K Chandran presently residing 

at SMQ N 13/15, Air Force 

Station, Sirsa (Haryana)-125055 

have changed my name from 

Sonia Gandhi to Soniyagandhi M 

vide affidavit No. 23282 dated 

09.11.2024 before Sirsa Court. 

I Chhinder Pal Singh S/O 

Balraj Singh R/O Vpo. Tharaj 

Distt. Moga Have Changed My 

Name To Chhinder Pal Singh 

Brar. 

I Harpreet D/O Daljit Singh 

R/O Vpo. Shergarh District 

Hoshiarpur Punjab Have 

Changed My Name To Harpreet 

Kaur.  

I Jasbir Kaur W/o Tarlok 

Singh R/o #203, Ward No.6, 

Sanaur District Patiala have 

changed my name to Jasvir Kaur. 

I Karamjeet Singh Rattol 

S/o Mukhtiar Singh R/o #26, 

Street No.2, Baljeet Colony, 

Ranjeet Avenue, Patiala have 

changed my name to Karamjit 

Singh Rattol. 

I, Paramjit Kaur Cheema 

D/o Hardyal Singh W/o Ajit Singh 

Cheema, R/o 67-A, Rani ka 

Bagh, Amritsar have changed my 

name to Paramjit Kaur. All 

concerned to note.

Classifieds

The Pioneer does not take 

responsibility for the contents 

for the advertisement (Display / 

Classified) carried in this 

newspaper. The Paper does 

not endorse the same. Readers 

are requested to verify the 

content on their own. 

Disclaimer

CHANGE OF NAME

PUBLIC NOTICE

BEDKHALI NOTICE

IN THE COURT OF Ms. NEELAM, 

Judicial Magistrate Ist Class, 

Amritsar 

NA CT/3 92 1/2 02 1 

CNR No.:PBA S03 02 102 5 2 02 1 

Next Date:-2 3 -12 -2 02 4 

KULDEEP KAUR W/O SH. MANBIR 

SINGH R/O H.NO. 22-A, LANE 

NO.2, S.J.S. AVENUE, AJNALA 

ROAD, AMRITSAR 

….Complainant 

Vs. 

KULWINDER KAUR 

U/S 138 NEGOTIABLE 

INSTRUMENTS ACT 

NOTICE TO: KULWINDER KAUR 

W/O SH. GURIDAL SINGH, R/O 

VPO MARI TANDA, MARI 

BUCHIAN, TEHSIL BATALA, 

DISTRICT GURDASPUR 

......A ccused. 

Whereas complaint has been made 

before me that the above said 

accused has committed (or) 

suspected to have committed the 

offence punishable under section 

138 of Negotiable Instrument Act and 

it has been returned to warrant of 

arrest thereupon issued that the said 

accused cannot be found and 

whereas it has been shown to my 

satisfaction that the said accused has 

absconded (or is concealing himself 

to avoid the service of the said 

warrant). 

Proclamation is hereby made that the 

said accused is required to appear 

before this Court (or before me) to 

answer the said complaint on 

2 3 -12 -2 02 4. 

For details logon to 

https://highcourtchd.gov.in/?trs=d

istrict_notice & district= Amritsar 

Judicial Magistrate 1st Class, 

Amritsar 

IN THE COURT OF Ms. NEELAM, 

Judicial Magistrate Ist Class, 

Amritsar 

NA CT/2 178/2 02 1 

CNR No.:PBA S03 0114642 02 1 

Next Date:-09-12 -2 02 4 

M/S LUCKY TEXTILES MILLS 

CARRYING ON ITS BUSINESS AT 

13, INDUSTRIAL ESTATE, P.O. 

RAYON SILK MILLS, CHHEHARTTA 

ROAD, AMRITSAR THROUGH ITS 

PROP. MANPREET KAUR BATRA 

THROUGH GENERAL POWER OF 

ATTORNEY JASPREET SINGH 

BATRA S/O SH. SATNAM SINGH 

BATRA R/O 345, GREEN AVENUE, 

AMRITSAR 

….Complainant 

Vs. 

M/S LEO FASHION 

U/S 138 NEGOTIABLE 

INSTRUMENTS ACT 

NOTICE TO: M/S LEO FASHION 

THROUGH ITS PROP. TARAN 

KOHLI, S/O JAGJIT SINGH KOHLI 

CARRYING ON ITS BUSINESS AT 

STREET NO. 3, FATEHGARH 

MOHALLA, GANDHI NAGAR, 

LUDHIANA 2 ND A DDRESS: 

GOKUL TOWER, 6TH FLOOR, FLAT 

NO. #614-B, NEAR 

GOVERNMENT AYURVEDIC 

COLLEGE ROAD, MOTI BAGH, 

PATIALA 

......A ccused. 

Whereas complaint has been made 

before me that the above said 

accused has committed (or) 

suspected to have committed the 

offence punishable under section 

138 of Negotiable Instrument Act and 

it has been returned to warrant of 

arrest thereupon issued that the said 

accused cannot be found and 

whereas it has been shown to my 

satisfaction that the said accused has 

absconded (or is concealing himself 

to avoid the service of the said 

warrant). 

Proclamation is hereby made that the 

said accused is required to appear 

before this Court (or before me) to 

answer the said complaint on 

09-12 -2 02 4. 

For details logon to 

https://highcourtchd.gov.in/?trs=d

istrict_notice & district= Amritsar 

Judicial Magistrate 1st Class, 

Amritsar 

IN THE COURT OF Ms. NEELAM, 

Judicial Magistrate Ist Class, 

Amritsar 

NA CT/2 177/2 02 1 

CNR No.:PBA S03 011463 2 02 1 

Next Date:-09-12 -2 02 4 

M/S LUCKY TEXTILES MILLS 

CARRYING ON ITS BUSINESS AT 

13, INDUSTRIAL ESTATE, P.O. 

RAYON SILK MILLS, CHHEHARTTA 

ROAD, AMRITSAR THROUGH ITS 

PROP. MANPREET KAUR BATRA 

THROUGH GENERAL POWER OF 

ATTORNEY JASPREET SINGH 

BATRA S/O SH. SATNAM SINGH 

BATRA R/O 345, GREEN AVENUE, 

AMRITSAR 

….Complainant 

Vs. 

M/S LEO FASHION 

U/S 138 NEGOTIABLE 

INSTRUMENTS ACT 

NOTICE TO:- M/S LEO FASHION 

THROUGH ITS PROP. TARAN 

KOHLI, S/O JAGJIT SINGH KOHLI 

CARRYING ON ITS BUSINESS AT 

STREET NO. 3, FATEHGARH 

MOHALLA, GANDHI NAGAR, 

LUDHIANA 2 ND A DDRESS: 

GOKUL TOWER, 6TH FLOOR, FLAT 

NO. #614-B, NEAR 

GOVERNMENT AYURVEDIC 

COLLEGE ROAD, MOTI BAGH, 

PATIALA 

......A ccused. 

Whereas complaint has been made 

before me that the above said accused 

has committed (or) suspected to have 

committed the offence punishable 

under section 138 of Negotiable 

Instrument Act and it has been 

returned to warrant of arrest thereupon 

issued that the said accused cannot be 

found and whereas it has been shown 

to my satisfaction that the said accused 

has absconded (or is concealing 

himself to avoid the service of the said 

warrant). 

Proclamation is hereby made that the 

said accused is required to appear 

before this Court (or before me) to 

answer the said complaint on 

09-12 -2 02 4. 

For details logon to 

https://highcourtchd.gov.in/?trs=d

istrict_notice & district= Amritsar 

Judicial Magistrate 1st Class, 

Amritsar 

COURT NOTICE

COURT NOTICE

COURT NOTICE
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Himachal Governor Shiv
Pratap Shukla and Chief

Minister Sukhvinder Singh
Sukhu inaugurated the
Sadbhavana T-20 Cricket
Tournament on Saturday at
Bishop Cotton School, Shimla.
The event was organised by the
HIM Sports and Cultural
Association, began with a
match between Governor's XI
and Press XI.

Governor's XI won the toss
and chose to bat first. Their
strong performance was led by
Vivek Bhatia, who scored 106
runs and Abid Hussain who
added 118 runs. The team set an
impressive target of 255 runs by
losing only one wicket. In
response, Press XI struggled and
was all out for just 74 runs,
resulting in a resounding victory
for Governor's XI by 181 runs.

Addressing the gathering,
Governor Shukla emphasized
the deeper purpose of the
event. He said that beyond
sportsmanship it spreads
awareness about drug addic-
tion. He said the tournament’s
theme, “Leave addiction, play
sports,” was a powerful message
to inspire young people to stay
away from drugs. He said that
drug abuse was a significant
societal challenge and urged
collective action to make
Himachal Pradesh, known as

Devbhoomi free from this
menace. He also announced
plans for a comprehensive anti-
drug campaign to be conduct-
ed at the grassroots level across
villages.

Chief Minister Sukhu
praised the organizers for their
efforts to highlight the harm-
ful effects of drug abuse
through this sporting event. He
said that the participation of
teams represents the four pil-
lars of democracy and sends a
strong & positive message to
society. He said that the state
government was committed to
fight against drug menace and
in this direction working with
dedication to promote sports
and improve opportunities for
youth.

Sukhu highlighted several
measures taken by the govern-
ment to support athletes. The

prize money for winners of
international competitions
such as the Olympics,
Paralympics and Asian Games,
has been significantly
increased. Gold medalists now
receive Rs. 5 crore, silver
medalists Rs. 3 crore and
bronze medalists Rs. 2 crore.
Similarly, in the Asian Games
and Para Asian Games the
prize money for gold medalists
was increased to Rs. 4 crore,
with Rs. 2.5 crore and Rs. 1.5
crore for silver and bronze
medalists, respectively. He said
that Paralympians like Nishad
Kumar and Ajay Kumar have
been recognised with substan-
tial monetary rewards for their
achievements.

He said that to further
encourage athletes, the state
government has enhanced
allowances, including diet

allowances, and improved trav-
el provisions for competitions.
Athletes now receive AC three-
tier train fare for journeys up
to 200 kilometres and econo-
my-class airfare for longer dis-
tances. He said that the gov-
ernment has also announced
the construction of integrated
sports complexes in all con-
stituencies. These facilities aim
to foster greater participation in
sports and provide modern
amenities which would help
young people stay away from
drug abuse and embrace a
healthier lifestyle.

Both the Governor and
CM expressed hope that the
tournament would inspire the
youth to lead fulfilling lives free
from addiction while promot-
ing a culture of sportsmanship
and community well-being.
President of HIM Sports and
Cultural Association Naresh
Chauhan welcomed the
Governor and Chief Minister
and honoured them with
Himachali Cap and Shawl.

Speaker, Himachal Pradesh
Legislative Assembly Kuldeep
Singh Pathania, Acting Chief
Justice of Himachal Pradesh
High Court Justice Tarlok
Singh Chauhan, Health and
Family Welfare Minister Dr.
(Col.) Dhani Ram Shandil and
Industries Minister
Harshwardhan Chauhan and
other dignitaries were also pre-
sent on the occasion.
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Shiromani Akali Dal leader
Sukhbir Singh Badal on

Saturday performed the duty of
‘sewadar’ outside a gurdwara in
Punjab’s Fatehgarh Sahib amid
tight security. Badal, who was sit-
ting in a wheelchair due to a frac-
tured leg, also listened to ‘kirtan’
and washed dishes in the com-
munity kitchen.

The former deputy chief
minister, a Z+ protectee, arrived
at the gurdwara surrounded by
security personnel. He wore a
blue ‘sewadar’ uniform and sat at
the gurdwara entrance with a
spear in one hand for an hour
from 9 am. Saturday is the fifth
day of Badal’s penance for “mis-
takes” made by the SAD and its
government in Punjab from
2007 to 2017.

Other SAD leaders, who are
also undergoing religious pun-
ishment pronounced by the Akal
Takht, the highest temporal body
of Sikhs, on December 2, were
also present in the gurdwara.

Besides the Golden Temple
in Amritsar, the Akal Takht has
asked Badal to perform the duty
of ‘sewadar’ at the Takht Kesgarh
Sahib, Takht Damdama Sahib,
and Darbar Sahib in Muktsar and
Fatehgarh Sahib for two days
each.

On the second day of his
penance at the Golden Temple on
December 4, Badal had a narrow

escape as former Khalistani ter-
rorist Narain Singh Chaura fired
at him from a close range but
missed as he was overpowered by
plainclothes policemen and later
arrested.
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A day before, the Shiromani
Akali Dal (SAD) rejected the
Punjab Police’s probe, labeling it
a cover-up to shield those alleged-
ly responsible. Following the
high-stakes meeting in
Chandigarh, the SAD core com-
mittee claimed that the attack was
a sinister attempt to target not
only their leader but also the Sikh
community’s rich traditions and
values.

SAD’s acting president
Balwinder Singh Bhundar called
it a direct assault on the Khalsa
heritage and the sanctity of Sri
Harmandir Sahib (Golden
Temple), where Sukhbir Badal
was performing voluntary service
at the time of the incident. The
party resolved to approach
Punjab Governor Gulab Chand
Kataria to demand an impartial
probe into the incident, claiming
that the state police could not be
trusted to conduct a fair investi-
gation.

Senior leaders Bikram Singh
Majithia and Daljit Singh

Cheema alleged that key police
officers, including SP Harpal
Randhawa, were complicit in the
conspiracy. “It appears that AAP
facilitated the attacker Narain
Singh Chaura to reach Sukhbir
Badal. The SP’s behaviour on the
day of the attack, including
attempts to isolate Sukhbir Badal,
raises serious questions about his
role,” said Majithia. The leaders
also accused the State
Government of trying to exploit
the incident to create conditions
reminiscent of Punjab’s dark era.
“The attack is part of a calculat-
ed plan to stoke unrest and tar-
get Sikh youth under the guise of
law and order measures,” they
asserted.

The incident occurred dur-
ing Sukhbir Badal’s religious
punishment (tankha) at the
Golden Temple. On the second
day of his ‘sewa’, Chaura alleged-
ly fired a shot at him, which was
foiled by the quick response of
Punjab Police cops. The SAD
leadership praised alertness and
bravery of ASI Jasbir Singh and

his compatriot, highlighting that
he was off duty and had come to
the shrine on his own. The party,
however, condemned the
Government’s attempts to down-
play the attack.

Meanwhile, the SAD
announced its decision to contest
the upcoming municipal corpo-
ration elections, a reversal of its
recent decision to abstain from
by-elections. “We will field can-
didates in all four municipal
corporations and 45 other
municipal bodies,” said Cheema,
signaling the party’s intent to
regain its political footing.

This meeting also marked
the first since the Akal Takht
raised concerns about the SAD’s
functioning during its govern-
ment tenure. The Takht had
recently directed the party to
reorganize its leadership within
six months, urging the induction
of new faces into its fold. The core
committee acknowledged the
directive and is expected to
deliberate on its implementation
in the coming days.
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In a concerted step towards
eliminating TB in India,

Union Health and Family
Welfare Minister,  J.P. Nadda on
Saturday launched the 100-day
intensified nationwide cam-
paign from Panchkula district in
Haryana. The campaign will be
implemented in 347 districts
across the country. Haryana
Chief Minister, Nayab Singh
Saini, Cabinet Minister,  Anil
Vij, Health Minister, Kumari
Aarti Singh Rao were present on
this occasion.

Addressing the people dur-
ing the national-level event at
Panchkula, Nadda said that
under this campaign, the focus
will be on TB-prone districts,
and high-risk groups, ensuring
comprehensive testing to pre-
vent its spread.

Lauding  Haryana's consis-
tent focus and efforts on further
strengthening healthcare infra-
structure, he said that due to the
dedicated efforts made by the
present state government, the
number of medical colleges in
Haryana has increased from 6
in 2014 to 15 today, with plans
to establish one in every district
under the leadership of Chief
Minister, Nayab Singh Saini.  He
said that even the MBBS seats
have increased from 650 in
2014 to 2,185, while postgrad-
uate seats have increased from
243 to 889.

The Union Minister said
that India had only six AIIMS
in 2014, compared to 22 today,
with one under construction in
Rewari, Haryana. Nadda said
that under the Ayushman
Bharat Scheme, 1.22 crore
Ayushman cards have been
issued in Haryana, facilitating
18.5 lakh hospital admissions.
Haryana has spent Rs. 2,700

crore providing free healthcare
to the underprivileged under
this scheme,  which is a com-
mendable achievement, he said.

The Health Minister said
that the central government
gives free treatment up to Rs. 5
lakh for senior citizens above 70
years under the Ayushman
Bharat Scheme. Haryana has
issued 70,000 Vay Vandana
cards as part of this initiative.
Neonatal screening has risen
from 63 percent to 85 percent,
and institutional delivery has
increased from 80 percent to 94
percent. Comprehensive immu-
nization has improved from 79
percent to 92 percent.

He said that there is a sig-
nificant reduction in TB cases,
with the decline rate improving
from 8.3 percent in 2015 to 17.7
percent  now. The World Health
Organization has commended
India's progress in reducing TB
prevalence and mortality rates,
which have dropped by 21.4
percent in the last 10 years.

Nadda shared that many
new strategies were adopted to
make TB services patient-
friendly and decentralized,
adding that  today early detec-
tion of TB has become possible
because of the network of over
1.7 lakh Ayushman Arogya
Mandirs across the country.
He  said that by increasing the
number of laboratories from
120 in 2014 to 8,293 laborato-
ries today, a significant step has
been taken  to scale up diag-
nostic services across the
Country. He said that with the
over 1.17 crore TB patients
have received Ni-kshay support
of Rs 3,338 crore. Besides this,
the state government has recent-
ly increased the Ni-kshay
poshan amount from Rs. 500 to
Rs. 1000 and added energy
boosters for the nourishment
support for TB patients.
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Aseminar focused on
Punjab's significant role in

nation-building and its excep-
tional contributions to the
Indian Army was conducted at
Chandimandir Military Station
on Saturday. The aim was to
address the contemporary chal-
lenges such as drug abuse,
socio-economic development,
and talent migration in Punjab,
a statement said.

The seminar brought
together the distinguished pan-
elists and subject experts from
Civil Administration, the Army
(serving and veterans),
Narcotics Control Bureau and
other eminent personalities
from civil society. The panel
explored the Punjab's contri-
butions to national security, rich
history, cultural heritage, and
tracing its journey from his-
torical glories to present chal-
lenges and suggested a way
ahead.

Lieutenant General Manoj
Kumar Katiyar, GOC-in-C,
Western Command sum-
marising with key takeaways

highlighted the role of youth of
Punjab in bringing about the
rejuvenation of Society and the
nation. While complimenting
the panelists for their insights
and suggestions, he urged
everyone to contribute towards
society and nation sincerely.

Discussions emphasized on
the economic distress afflicting
the state, socio-economic
impact of substance abuse
including its effects on National
security and the role of society
in curbing this menace. The
panel also discussed impact of
these challenges on recruit-
ment in Indian Army.
Actionable strategies for eco-
nomic resurgence, societal
reform, retention of talent pool,
enhancing recruitment, sub-
stance abuse mitigation mea-
sures were proposed by econ-
omists, NGOs, and veterans.
Veterans highlighted the poten-
tial of Punjab's youth as a back-
bone of the Army, while gov-
ernment officials proposed
measures for sustainable devel-
opment and skill-based initia-
tives to prepare the youth for
global competitiveness.

����������	��
��
�
����	��	
��
���

���������
������	��	���������

���� ������ ���

Haryana Chief Minister
Nayab Singh Saini on

Saturday said the government
is working on “4Ts” to elimi-
nate TB which are Test, Track,
Treat and Technology. He said
that intensified testing in the
last 10 years has led to the iden-
tification of new TB cases and
treatment of which is being
given free of cost.

Speaking at the  launch
programme of the countrywide
intensified 100 Day TB elimi-
nation campaign held at
Panchkula, Saini urged the
people to upload the data of
every new TB case in the Ni-
kshay portal which also pro-
vides timely updates to TB
patients. He  said that the
state government is working
with NGOs and civil society to
further bolster its TB elimina-
tion efforts.

Meanwhile, the Chief
Minister also expressed grati-
tude to Prime Minister
Narendra Modi and Union
Health and Family Welfare
Minister J.P. Nadda for choos-
ing Haryana to kickstart the
intensified 100-day TB cam-
paign.  He assured that
Haryana would strive to play a
prominent role in the fight
against TB in India.

Saini said over the past 10
years, India has fought against
TB through the medium of
successful campaigns like Jan
Bhagidari, Ni-kshay Poshan
Yojana, Fit India and Khelo

India which are admired across
the world. He said that the
launch of the 100-day National
Ni-kshay Camp for TB eradi-
cation will be a milestone in
this effort.

He said that the Haryana
government is providing even
more advanced technology to
eliminate TB. All existing X-ray
centers are being connected
with Indian Plasma Research
Institute in Ahmedabad
through AI to eliminate TB.
Haryana is the second state in
the country to implement this
technology. Two state-of-the-art
Micro Bacterial Culture and
DST Labs have been set up  in
Rohtak and Karnal. Besides
this, a new lab is being set up
in Ambala, said Saini. He said
that through 59 mobile health
vans, TB tests are being con-
ducted in villages, slums,
among daily wage workers,
brick kiln workers, and farmers.

The Chief Minister said
that if TB patients also suffer
from other illnesses, the gov-
ernment provides free treat-

ment for those as well. Four
Nodal Drug-Resistant TB
Centers have been established at
PGIMS Rohtak, as well as at
medical colleges in Karnal, Nuh,
and Sonipat. In addition, District
Nodal Drug-Resistant TB
Centers have been set up in all
22 districts. All patient samples
are sent to the nearest designat-
ed microscopy center for testing.
The number of such centers in
the state has increased from 358
to 428. Moreover, 131 new
DMCs are being opened.
Handheld X-rays with AI are
being used in all districts of the
state.

He added that all tests for
TB diagnosis are being con-
ducted free of charge. Patients
are provided free treatment
under the Ayushman scheme,
both in the government and pri-
vate sectors. So far, claims worth
Rs. 29 crore of 17,500 TB
patients have been settled. Even
in cases where the patient is not
eligible for the Ayushman
scheme, free treatment is pro-
vided.

Saini said that the positive
results of the initiatives taken
against TB are visible. More peo-
ple are coming forward to get
tested and treated for TB. In
2023, Haryana had 579 TB-free
Gram Panchayats. This year,
the target is to create approxi-
mately 1,800 TB-free Gram
Panchayats. He further shared
that the data of 79,652 patients
from the state has been uploaded
to the Ni-kshay portal. So far,
3.49 lakh patients have been pro-
vided financial assistance worth
Rs. 117.46 crore under the Ni-
kshay Poshan Yojana (NPY).

Earlier, speaking on the
occasion, Haryana Health
Minister, Kumari Arti Singh
Rao said that the the regular
screening and testing of the TB
patients is already being done
and now as a part of this newly
launched Campaign, the screen-
ing, testing and ensuring time-
ly treatment to maximum TB
patients within the next 100 days
will be further intensified. She
further shared that the Central
Government has increased the
monthly allowance being given
under Ni-kshay Poshan Yojana
(NPY) for TB patients from Rs.
500 to Rs.1,000  so as to ensure
they receive a nutritious diet.

She said that Ni-kshay vehi-
cles were flagged off by the
Union Health Minister. Many
people are unable to reach hos-
pitals, and their TB remains
undetected. These vehicles will
reach such individuals, con-
duct sample testing, and provide
treatment.
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Haryana Chief Minister
Nayab Singh Saini on

Saturday reviewed prepara-
tions being made at Panipat
ahead of Prime Minister
Narendra Modi's visit on
December 9. The Prime
Minister will launch the Bima
Sakhi Yojana from Panipat.

During the review, the
Chief Minister held meetings
with officers and issued neces-
sary directives. He said that the
government has always been
committed to women's
empowerment and the state is
actively working towards
empowering women. The
Deputy Commissioner
Virender Kumar Dahiya
assured the Chief Minister that
all arrangements for the pro-
gramme have been completed,
making it a historic event.

Saini said that the nation-
wide Bima Sakhi Yojana inau-
guration programme will be a
significant event dedicated to
women empowerment, adding
that in 2015, the Prime

Minister  had given the impact-
ful message of  ‘Beti Bachao-
Beti Padhao’ from the historic
city of Panipat only.

He said that the Bima
Sakhi Yojana will certainly fur-
ther give a major boost to
women empowerment, create
new employment opportuni-
ties, and enable them to
progress further. Enhancing
women's living standards
through self-help groups is a
key priority of the govern-
ment, he said.

Saini said that the passing
of the Women's Reservation
Bill by Prime Minister
Narendra Modi's government
has further strengthened
women's position as empow-
ering women significantly con-
tributes to the nation's devel-
opment.

The Chief Minister while
interacting with the media-
persons reaffirmed the gov-
ernment's robust efforts for
farmers welfare. He said that
despite attempts by some polit-
ical parties to mislead farmers,
they have not succeeded.
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Chandigarh: 61 Cavalry has won the Maharaja Ranjit Singh
National Polo Tournament being organized by Indian Polo
Association. Winning team beat the Indian Navy 4-1 in a thrilling
match on the seventh day of the event at Chandigarh Polo Club
on Saturday. Lt General Manoj Kumar Katiyar, GOC-in-C,
Western Command felicitated the winner, runner-up and other
teams in the presence of host Chandigarh Polo Club’s President
Dilpreet Singh Sidhu and Secretary Col Manoj Dewan. In his
address, Sidhu said that the first host to CPC was successfully orga-
nized where polo has got a new enthusiasm in the city and this
region. He lauded CPC is intensifying its efforts in the develop-
ment of this game with the cooperation of UT Administration.
Their focus is to host another Polo season next year in April which
will again host teams from all corners of the country.
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Chandigarh:The Vice President, Jagdeep Dhankhar will attend
the International Gita Mahotsav-2024 being held in Kurukshetra
on Sunday. Deputy Commissioner, Kurukshetra, Neha Singh said
to maintain law and order and peace from the security point of
view, on December 8. No vehicle should be parked on both sides
of the road within a radius of 100 meters on VIP Marg, NIT
Kurukshetra, Bhadrakali Shaktipeeth and its surroundings. Besides
this, there will be a complete ban on gathering of 5 or more per-
sons in the area of 100 meters of the VIP route, carrying sticks,
swords, axes, firearms and any other lethal weapon, open petrol,
diesel bottles, cans, flying drones/gliders at the helipad site, the
event venue on the VIP route and around it.
The Deputy Commissioner said any kind of ‘dharna’ demon-
stration within a radius of 500 meters of the event venue and on
both sides of the roads.
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Chandigarh:Punjab Housing and Urban Development Minister
Hardip Singh Mundian on Saturday handed over appointment
letters to three new employees recruited in the department. During
a function in Chandigarh, he handed over appointment letters
to Law Officer Kulwant Singh and Clerks Rupali and Milanpreet
Kaur. He welcomed them to the department. On this occasion,
Chief Secretary KAP Sinha and Secretary Rahul Tiwari were also
present. Mundian said the State Government has recruited more
than 50 thousand employees so far during two and a half years.
Around 223 employees have been recruited by the Housing and
Urban Development department. He said that the department
will fill the vacant posts in the coming time.
The Minister further said that the government is providing employ-
ment opportunities to the youth of the state in the state itself. Apart
from this, by encouraging investment, an investor-friendly envi-
ronment has been created, due to which employment opportu-
nities are also being created in the private sector. This is also giv-
ing a boost to the economic development of the state.
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Chandigarh: To harness solar energy for greening the agricul-
ture sector in the state, the Punjab Energy Development Agency
(PEDA) will install 2,356 solar pumps dedicated to agricultural
purposes. Punjab's New and Renewable Energy Sources Minister,
Aman Arora, handed over work orders to AVI Appliances Pvt.
Ltd., PV Power Technologies Pvt. Ltd., and Himalayan Solar Pvt.
Ltd. for the installation of 2,356 solar pumps for agricultural use
in the state. Arora informed that these companies were selected
through a transparent and competitive bidding process. The instal-
lation of these pumps is expected to be completed within four
months. A subsidy of 60% for general category farmers and 80%
for the Scheduled Caste (SC) farmers is available for the solar
pumps with capacities of 3, 5, 7.5, and 10 HP. In dark zones (over-
exploited groundwater blocks), these pumps will be installed to
farmers who already have micro irrigation systems, such as drip
or sprinkler systems, installed on their bore-wells, he added. With
the installation of these solar pumps, he said while adding that
the farmers will no longer need to go to their farms at night for
irrigation, as these pumps operate during the daytime. This will
not only reduce fuel costs but also result in zero percent carbon
emissions, promoting a more sustainable farming practice. Arora
also directed the PEDA officials to initiate dedicated efforts towards
the installation of more agriculture solar pumps for the welfare
of the farmers.
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Chandigarh:Haryana Governor Bandaru Dattatraya, on the occa-
sion of the Armed Forces Flag Day on Saturday, paid his tribute
to the indomitable courage and sacrifices of the men and women
of the armed forces who have dedicated their lives to safeguard-
ing the sovereignty and honour of our nation. He acknowledged
the heroic contributions of our valiant soldiers, both past and pre-
sent, who have displayed unparalleled bravery and devotion to
the country.  Dattatraya has called upon the people of Haryana
and the nation to come together in supporting the welfare of war-
disabled soldiers, Veer Naris, and the families of our martyrs. “Let
us reaffirm our commitment to those who have given everything
for our motherland by contributing generously to the Armed
Forces Flag Day Fund. Your contributions will make a tangible
difference in the lives of those who have borne the greatest bur-
dens for the country’s safety and dignity,” he said.
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Shimla: Chief Minister
Sukhvinder Singh Sukhu was
pinned up the flag on the
occasion of Armed Forces
Flag Day here on Saturday by
Director Sainik Welfare
Department Brigadier Madan
Sheel Sharma. He also con-
tributed towards the Armed
Welfare Fund and also urged
the people of the State to contribute towards this fund generously
as it was utilized for the welfare of serving and ex-servicemen.
Health and Sainik Welfare Minister Dr. (Col.) Dhani Ram Shandil
and MLA Harish Janartha were also present on the occasion.
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Shimla: Himachal Chief Minister Sukhvinder Singh Sukhu on
Saturday underwent tuberculosis (TB) screening using a portable
X-ray machine in a function organized as a part of ‘Ni-Kshay
Abhiyan’ here  in which he was also Chief Guest. He also flagged
off a mobile van dedicated to the initiative. Speaking on the occa-
sion, Sukhu said that the 100-day ‘Ni-Kshay Abhiyan’ is a sig-
nificant step towards making Himachal Pradesh TB-free. The cam-
paign aims to ensure timely identification of TB cases, effective
treatment and increased awareness within communities. He said
that the campaign will be conducted in all districts of the State,
with a special focus on vulnerable and marginalized groups and
appealed to everyone to actively participate in the Ni-Kshay camps
campaign in their areas and encourage people to recognize TB
symptoms and seek timely testing. Sukhu expressed confidence
that Himachal Pradesh is on the path to becoming TB-free, adding
that the state government has allocated an additional Rs. 2 crore
for the Chief Minister’s TB Eradication Scheme, supplementing
the central government’s budget. He also said that 13 percent of
the state’s population is above 60 years, making early diagnosis
and prevention crucial for older adults. He stressed the impor-
tance of awareness and healthy lifestyles for younger generations
to prevent diseases.

������



������ ����������	�
�
�
���� �
�������	
��
����


���������������������
&�'����()

Prime Minister Narendra
Modi on Saturday said

his government has taken
another big decision to make
school education as accessi-
ble as possible with the
Cabinet approving the open-
ing of 85 new Kendriya
Vidyalayas.
He asserted that while the
step will benefit a large
number of students, many
new employment
opportunities will also be
created. 
"Our government has taken
another big decision to
make school education as
accessible as possible. Under
this, 85 new Kendriya
Vidyalayas will be opened
across the country. 
While this step will benefit a
large number of students,
many new employment
opportunities will also be

created," Modi said in a
social media post.
The prime minister said the
government is committed to
providing school education
to every section of the
society in accordance with
the National Education

Policy.
"As part of that, our
government has approved
28 new Navodaya
Vidyalayas across the
country. This will expand
residential and quality
school education to a larger

extent," Modi said in
another post in Hindi.
The prime minister also said
his government is
determined to improve
connectivity across the
country. "In this direction,
our government has
approved the Rithala-
Kundli corridor under the
fourth phase of Delhi Metro
in the National Capital
Region. This will make
commuting between Delhi
and Haryana easier," Modi
said. The Union Cabinet
approved on Friday the
opening of 85 new KVs and
28 new NVs.
It also gave its nod to
expanding one KV. 
The opening of these new
KVs will provide an
opportunity for over 82,000
students to receive
affordable and high-quality
education across the
country. The total estimated
requirement of funds for the

establishment of the 85 new
KVs and the expansion of
one existing KVs is Rs
5,872.08 crore spread over a
period of eight years from
2025-26. As of date, there
are 1,256 functional
Kendriya Vidyalayas,
including three abroad -
Moscow, Kathmandu and
Tehran - and 13.56 lakh
students are studying in
these schools, an official
statement said.
The Union Cabinet also
approved on Friday the
26.463-km Rithala-Kundli
corridor of the Delhi
Metro's Phase-IV project
that will further enhance
connectivity between the
national capital and
neighbouring Haryana. 
The entire stretch will
comprise 21 stations, all of
them elevated. The
decisions were taken at a
Cabinet meeting chaired by
Modi.

Government committed to make school
education accessible: PM Modi
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The Enforcement
Directorate (ED) on

Saturday said it has attached
fresh assets worth about Rs
388 crore in its ongoing money
laundering investigation into
the Mahadev online betting
case in which various high-
ranking politicians and
bureaucrats from Chhattisgarh
are alleged to have been
involved.
These include movable assets
- investment made by
Mauritius-based company
Tano Investment
Opportunities Fund related
to Dubai-based "hawala
operator" Hari Shankar
Tibrewal through FPI and
FDI - and properties in
Chhattisgarh, Mumbai and
Madhya Pradesh in the name
of promoters of multiple
betting apps and websites,
panel operators and
associates of the promoters,
the federal agency said in a
statement. 
A provisional order was
issued under the Prevention

of Money Laundering Act
(PMLA) on December 5 to
attach these assets with a
total value of Rs 387.99 crore,
the Enforcement Directorate
(ED) said. 
Tibrewal is being
investigated by the agency in
this case. 
The ED has issued multiple
such orders during this
investigation and with the
latest order, assets worth Rs
2,295.61 crore have been
either frozen, attached or
seized so far. 
Eleven people have been
arrested in this case and the
ED has filed four
chargesheets. 
The agency has alleged in the

past that its probe into the
Mahadev Online Betting
(MOB) gaming and betting
app has shown the
involvement of various high-
ranking politicians and
bureaucrats from
Chhattisgarh. 
The app's two main
promoters, Sourabh
Chandrakar and Ravi Uppal,
hail from the state. 
According to the ED, the
MOB app is an umbrella
syndicate arranging online
platforms for enabling illegal
betting websites to enrol new
users, create user IDs and
launder money through a
layered web of benami bank
accounts.
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Defence Minister Rajnath
Singh will embark on a

three-day trip to Russia on
Sunday to witness the com-
missioning of a stealth warship
into the Indian Navy and hold
talks with his Russian coun-
terpart Andrey Belousov on the
expansion of bilateral cooper-
ation in co-production of mil-
itary hardware.
The Russian-manufactured
multi-role stealth guided
missile frigate INS Tushil will
be commissioned on Monday
in the coastal city of
Kaliningrad. The warship,
billed as one of the most
technologically advanced
frigates globally, is expected
to significantly bolster the
Indian Navy's operational
capability in the Indian
Ocean, a region that has
witnessed increasing Chinese
forays. Chief of the Naval Staff
Admiral Dinesh K Tripathi

will accompany Singh to the
commissioning ceremony.
Defence Minister Singh will
pay an official visit to the
Russian Federation from
December 8 to 10, an official
readout said on Saturday.
It said Singh and Belousov
will co-chair the 21st meeting
of the India-Russia Inter-
Governmental Commission
on Military and Military
Technical Cooperation
(IRIGC-M&MTC) in
Moscow on December 10.
The defence minister's visit to
Russia comes five months
after Prime Minister
Narendra Modi travelled to
Moscow and held summit
talks with Russian President
Vladimir Putin. In the talks,
both sides decided to further
bolster two-way defence ties.
Singh and Belousov will
review the entire range of
multi-faceted relations
between the two countries in
the field of defence, including
military-to-military and

industrial cooperation, the
defence ministry said in the
readout. "They will also
exchange views on
contemporary regional and
global issues of mutual
interest," it said.
People familiar with Singh's
visit said India-Russia
cooperation in co-production
of military hardware will
figure prominently in the
talks between the two defence
ministers. "As part of the visit,
the defence minister will also
commission the Indian
Navy's latest multi-role stealth
guided missile frigate 'INS
Tushil' at Yantra Shipyard,
Kaliningrad on December 9,"
the ministry said.
It said Singh will also pay
tributes at 'The Tomb of the
Unknown Soldier' in Moscow
to honour the Soviet soldiers
killed during the Second
World War. He is also
scheduled to interact with the
members of the Indian
community in Moscow.
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CISF has set up a quality
control unit to "enhance"

the "operational efficiency" of
its aviation security wing that
provides a counter-terrorist
cover to 68 civil airports of the
country. 
An spokesperson for the
paramilitary force said on
Saturday that the Internal
Quality Control Unit (IQCU)
will play a "crucial" role in

establishing "world-class"
security procedures and
technology for the airports
that are used by lakhs of
domestic and international
passengers every day.
The initiative is in
compliance with the National
Civil Aviation Security
Quality Control Programme
(NCASQCP) of 2024 issued
by the Bureau of Civil
Aviation Security (BCAS)
and the Aircraft (Security)
Rules of 2023, he said. 
The BCAS, under the civil
aviation ministry, frames
security policies for the
Indian civil aviation sector.
The new unit will bring about
uniformity in civil aviation
security procedures and
training, recommend new
technology available world
over, allow internal audits of
CISF security units and their
protocols and identify "gaps"
for improvement.

The unit will be part of CISF's
Aviation Security Control
Center (ASCC) - located in
the national capital - which
works as a centralised base
for coordinating security at
all 68 civil airports that are
under the security ambit of
the force.
The latest system will also
cover the airports that come
under Regional Connectivity
Scheme (UDAAN), the
spokesperson said. 
"The IQCU will be led by a
senior CISF officer and a
team of certified aviation
security instructors will run
it," he said.
The about 1.80 lakh people-
strong Central Industrial
Security Force, under the
Union home ministry, is the
national civil aviation
security force and it has
deployed around 50,000
personnel to guard the 68
airports.
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Giving a ray of hope to
patients who received

faulty implants manufactured
by DePuy International
Limited (now Johnson &
Johnson Private Limited) in
India, the Union Health
Ministry has reconstituted a
central panel of experts to
determine the compensation
for affected individuals. 
A recent public notice issued
by the Drugs Controller
General of India (DCGI)
informed the public about the
reconstitution of this
committee. 
"The central expert
committee is reconstituted
under the chairmanship of Dr
Ajay Kumar Shukla, Professor
of Orthopaedics, RML
Hospital (New Delhi), to
determine the quantum of

compensation as admissible
and medical management for
the affected patients who were
implanted with faulty ASR
hip implants," the notice read.
The ASR hip implants were
manufactured by M/s DePuy
international Limited, UK
and imported by M/s DePuy
Medical Private, Mumbai -
now Johnson and Johnson
Private Limited - according to
the notice. 
In 2010, the company issued a
global recall on the product
following complaints related
to hip implants from other
parts of the world. 
The affected patients who
were implanted with faulty
ASR hip implants and are
suffering from disability and
other losses may approach
either the Central Expert
Committee or the state-level
committee in accordance with
their convenience.
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Christ ian community
should take an in-princi-

ple stand on the Waqf Bill as
it affects minority rights
enshrined in the
Constitution, Christian MPs
are learnt to have told the
Catholic Bishops' Conference
of India (CBCI) at a meeting
in the national capital.
CBCI, the apex body of
Catholics in India, called a
meeting on December 3 of
all Christian MPs. 
The meeting was attended
by around 20 MPs, most of
them from opposition

parties. TMC's
parliamentary party leader
Derek O'Brien, Congress
MPs Hibi Eden, Dean
Kuriakose, Anto Antony,
and CPI (M) MP John
Brittas were among the MPs
who attended the meeting,
while union Minister of
State George Kurian joined
later, a source who was
present at the meeting told
PTI. CBCI president
Archbishop Andrews
chaired the meeting, the
first such held in decades.
The meeting's agenda
included the role of
Christian MPs in

supporting and protecting
the community and its
rights, increasing attacks
and threats against
minorities, especially
Christians, and misuse of
FCRA to target Christian
institutions. The source said
a senior opposition MP
suggested that the
community leadership
should also highlight
"positive points, the
important role being played
by the community today"
and "not just be only
reactive to negative news."
A suggestion made was to
convey to the government

and the public that three out
of four students in Christian
institutions, were in fact
from different communities.
One MP said that there is a
need to put a stop to "photo
ops," and stressed that the
Christian leadership should
take a stand to "call out
those who are not
protecting the
Constitution." Another MP
who attended the meeting
confirmed that multiple
opposition MPs raised
strong objections to certain
provisions of The Waqf
(Amendment) Bill, now
under the consideration of

the Joint Parliamentary
Committee (JPC). 
The Bill, among other
things, changes the
composition of the Central
Waqf Council and Waqf
Boards to include non-
Muslim members. Another
MP from Kerela told PTI
that the issue of seats for
Anglo Indians (all
Christians) in Lok Sabha
and 10 state assemblies
being abolished was also
raised, and Foreign
Contribution Regulation
Act (FCRA) licences of
some Christian
organisations being targeted

and cancelled in recent
years was also brought up.
"The meeting was held in a
cordial atmosphere but the
MPs sharply criticised the
church leadership's
handling of its relationship
with the government since
2014. One MP even
suggested it was getting
'transactional,' a leader who
attended the meeting told
PTI. By the time, Kurien, a
BJP leader and Union
minister, came most
opposition MPs were done
speaking, the source said.
Two BJP MPs, both
Christians, were absent.
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Seventy-three complaints have
been received against

obscene and vulgar advertise-
ments on private television
channels by the regulatory bod-
ies over the past three years, the
government has told parlia-
ment.
In a written reply in the Rajya
Sabha, Minister of State for
Information and Broadcasting
L Murugan said the
complaints were "suitably"
addressed by a three-level
grievance redress system.
Murugan said the mechanism,
established under the Cable
Television Networks
(Amendment) Rules, includes
self-regulation by
broadcasters, self-regulation
by self-regulating bodies of the
broadcasters, and an oversight
mechanism of the central
government.
The minister said appropriate

action is taken wherever
violation of the Advertising
Code is found by issuance of
"Advisories, Warnings,
'Apology Scroll' Orders and
Off-air orders."
In reply to a separate question,
Murugan said OTT platforms
are required to adhere to the
Code of Ethics under Part-III
of the IT (Intermediary
Guidelines and Digital Media
Ethics Code) Rules, 2021. 
"These codes are self-
regulatory in nature," the
minister said.
Murugan said these Code of
Ethics require the publishers
not to transmit any content
which is prohibited by law and
to undertake age-based self-
classification of content into
five categories, based on
general guidelines provided in
the Rules.
The guidelines provide that
while undertaking such self
classification, the context of
the period depicted in such
content and the contemporary
standards of the country and
people to which such content
relate, are to be kept in mind,
he said. Murugan said the
Code also provides that the
OTT platforms will put in
place adequate safeguard for
restricting age inappropriate
content for children.
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Health Minister J P Nadda
on Saturday said the rate

of decline of tuberculosis inci-
dence in India has doubled
since 2015 and is ahead of the
global average. 
Nadda said this while
inaugurating a nationwide
campaign in Haryana's
Panchkula to reduce such
cases and mortality due to it.
The 100-day TB elimination
campaign will be
implemented in 347 districts
of 33 states where the
prevalence of the disease is
higher. 
The campaign is focused on
enhancing detection,
reducing diagnostic delays
and improving treatment
outcomes.
"Under this programme, we
have taken detection, tests,
treatment and supportive
strategies forward in an
accelerated way. 
I feel this 100-day
programme will prove to be
a milestone in making a 'TB-
mukt Bharat' and it will have
a far-reaching impact,"
Nadda said.
The Union health minister
highlighted the country's
long struggle in its fight
against tuberculosis, saying
that at one time TB meant a
'slow death'. 
"Even family members

suffering from TB were
isolated to prevent its spread.
Since 1962, there have been
many campaigns against
tuberculosis, but in 2018 the
prime minister put forth a
vision to end TB much
before the 2030 deadline of
the Sustainable Development
Goals." "We changed
strategies to achieve the aim. 
Services have been
decentralised and now,
1,73,000 AAMs (Ayushman
Arogya Mandirs) will have
the facilities to detect and
treat tuberculosis," the
Union health minister said.
He also informed the
gathering that molecular
technologies have been
introduced for TB detection.
Also, a new and shorter
regimen of tuberculosis
treatment has been started
which will help increase
compliance and fight TB, he
said.
In 2014, there were 120
laboratories for TB detection
and their number has now
reached 8,293, said Nadda. 

He highlighted that the rate
of tuberculosis incidence
decline in India has doubled
from 8.3 per cent in 2015 to
17.7 per cent now, which is
much ahead of the global
average. 
Deaths due to tuberculosis
have also reduced
significantly in India by 21.4
per cent in the last 10 years,
he said.
"Ni-kshay support worth Rs
3,338 crore has been
provided through direct
benefit transfer to over 1.17
crore tuberculosis patients,"
the minister said and
underscored the government
has increased Ni-kshay
poshan amount recently
from Rs 500 to Rs 1,000 and
added energy boosters for
the nourishment support for
TB patients.
Ni-kshay Poshan is not only
a policy decision, this is a
financial commitment for
people in the health sector to
eliminate TB, he said. 
Nadda said the government
has now made it mandatory
for even private practitioners
to notify any new
tuberculosis patient so that
their treatment can be
followed up immediately.
"This might look like a small
step but it has led to an
eight-fold increase in the
rate of TB notifications in
the private sector," Nadda
said.

The 100-day campaign
underscores the Union
government's commitment
to achieving the goal of end-
TB by addressing the
challenges of tuberculosis
notification and mortality in
India under the National TB
Elimination Programme of
the Ministry of Health and
Family Welfare.
Some of the key focus areas
of the campaign are
increasing access to
advanced diagnostics,
targeted screening among
vulnerable groups,
specialized care for high-risk
individuals, and provision of
expanded nutritional
support. Speaking about
Haryana, he said earlier,
there were only six medical
colleges and now the number
has grown to 15. 
The Haryana chief minister
has announced to opening a
medical college in each
district, he said.
Nadda further said the
number of undergraduate
seats for doctors has
increased from 650 in 2014
to 2,185 in Haryana. 
Similarly, the number of
post-graduate seats
increased from 243 to 889
now, he added. 
On this occasion, Haryana
Chief Minister Nayab Singh
Saini and state Health
Minister Arti Singh Rao
were also present.
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Still to recover from a shock-
ing defeat in the recent

Maharashtra Assembly polls,
the Opposition Maha Vikas
Aghadi (MVA) on Saturday
staged a walkout from the
Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly during the first day of
the oath-taking ceremony, alleg-
ing that the BJP-led MahaYuti
registered a landslide victory in
the Assembly polls because of
the manipulation of Electronic
Voting Machines (EVMs).
However, the MLAs belonging
to the MVA - comprising the
Congress, Shiv Sena (UBT)
and NCP (SP) may take oath
on Sunday, the second and
final day of the oath-taking
ceremony. While the MVA
MLAs staged a walk out en
masse from the State
Assembly, two MLAs
belonging to the Akhilesh
Yadav-led Samajwadi Party
took oath. The three MVA
constituents collectively
account for 46 MLAs in a 288-
member State Assembly as
against the combined strength
of the ruling MahaYuti -
comprising BJP, Shiv Sena (ES)
and NCP (Ajit Pawar-of 235 in
the House. After staging a
walkout from the House, the
MVA leaders gathered near
the statue of  Chhatrapati
Shivaji Maharaj and explained
their stage a walk from the
State Assembly,
Talking to media persons, state
Congress President and senior
party MLA Nana Patole said:
"Despite the BJP alliance
forming the government after
the state assembly elections,
the public sentiment is that
this government does not
reflect their votes. It is not a
government of the people's
mandate. The sentiment of the
people in Markadwadi mirrors
that of the majority in the
state. Respecting public
opinion, members of the
Mahavikas Aghadi (MVA)
have decided not to take their
oath today". "We boycotted the
oath-taking ceremony as
democracy is being murdered

by the use of EVMs. This is not
the mandate of the public, it is
the mandate of EVM and the
Election Commission of
India," said Shiv Sena (UBT)
MLA Aaditya Thackeray, who
is the leader of the legislature
party. Meanwhile, pro-tem
Speaker Kalidas Kolambkar -
who is administering oath to
the newly elected members -
administered oath to a
majority of 235 ruling MVA
members on Saturday. He will
complete the administration
of oath-taking to rest of the
new members on Sunday.
On Monday, there will be
election to the post of Speaker
of the Legislative Assembly,
which is a mere formality
considering the small strength
of the Opposition.
This is for the first time in the
history of Maharashtra, that
there would not be a Leader of
the Opposition (LoP) in the
state Assembly.
The Opposition MVA -
comprising Congress, Shiv
Sena (UBT) and NCP (Sharad
Pawar) -put up a pathetic
performance by winning a
meagre 46 seats. While the
Shiv Sena (UBT) secured 20
seats, the Congress and NCP
(SP) won 16 and 10 seats
respectively. Such was the rout
of the MVA in the polls that
there will be no Leader of the
Opposition (LoP) in the State
Assembly. Because, none of
the MVA constituents -
Congress, Shiv Sena (UBT)
and NCP (Sharad Pawar) - has
won 10 per cent of the total
288 seats in the House to stake
a claim for the LoP's post. In
view of the fact that none of
the Opposition parties -
including Congress, Shiv Sena
(UBT) and NCP ( SP) -
managed to get even ten per
cent of the total 288 seats,
Fadnavis was earlier asked if
there will be a leader of the
Opposition in the State
Assembly. "We will treat the
Opposition with respect. As
far as LoP is concerned, it is a
decision to be taken by the
Speaker," the chief minister
said.
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ASouth Korean legisla-
tive push to impeach
President Yoon Suk Yeol

over his short-lived imposition
of martial law fell through on
Saturday after most lawmakers
from his conservative govern-
ing party boycotted the vote.
The defeat of the motion is
expected to intensify public
protests calling for Yoon’s
ouster and deepen political
chaos in South Korea, with a
survey suggesting a majority of
South Koreans support the
president’s impeachment.
Yoon’s martial law declaration
drew criticism from his own
ruling conservative party, but it
is also determined to oppose
Yoon’s impeachment appar-
ently because it fears losing the
presidency to liberals.
Impeaching Yoon required
support from two-thirds of
the National Assembly, or 200
of its 300 members. The oppo-
sition parties who brought the
impeachment motion had 192
seats, but only three lawmak-
ers from PPP participated in
the vote. The motion was
scrapped without ballot count-
ing because the number of
votes didn’t reach 200.
National Assembly Speaker
Woo Won Shik called the result
“very regrettable” and an
embarrassing moment for the
country’s democracy that has

been closely watched by the
world. “The failure to hold a
qualified vote on this matter
means we were not even able to
exercise the democratic proce-
dure of deciding on a critical
national issue,” he said.
Opposition parties could sub-
mit a new impeachment
motion after a new parliamen-
tary session opens next
Wednesday.
There are worries that Yoon
won’t be able to serve out his
remaining 2 ½ years in office
because his leadership took a
huge hit. Many experts say
some ruling party lawmakers
could eventually join opposi-
tion parties’ efforts to impeach
Yoon if public demands for it
grow further.
If Yoon is impeached, his pow-
ers will be suspended until the
Constitutional Court decides
whether to remove him from
office. If he is removed, an elec-
tion to replace him must take
place within 60 days.
Woo repeatedly urged ruling
party members to return to the
chamber to participate in the
vote, waiting several hours for
them to come.
At one point, Democratic Party
leaders visited a hall on the
floor below the main chamber
where PPP lawmakers were
gathered, attempting to per-
suade them to vote. After being
blocked from entering, they
angrily accused the conserva-

tives’ leadership of preventing
its lawmakers from voting
freely.
Earlier Saturday, Yoon issued a
public apology over the martial
law decree, saying he won’t
shirk legal or political respon-
sibility for the declaration and
promising not to make anoth-
er attempt to impose martial
law. He said would leave it to
his party to chart a course
through the country’s political
turmoil, “including matters
related to my term in office.”
“The declaration of this martial
law was made out of my des-
peration. But in the course of
its implementation, it caused
anxiety and inconveniences to
the public. I feel very sorry over
that and truly apologise to the
people who must have been
shocked a lot,” Yoon said.
Since taking office in 2022,
Yoon has struggled to push his
agenda through an opposi-
tion-controlled parliament and
grappled with low approval
ratings amid scandals involving
himself and his wife.
In his martial law announce-
ment on Tuesday night, Yoon
called parliament a “den of
criminals” bogging down state
affairs and vowed to eliminate
“shameless North Korea follow-
ers and anti-state forces.”
The turmoil resulting from
Yoon’s bizarre and poorly-
thought-out stunt has paralysed
South Korean politics and

sparked alarm among key
diplomatic partners like the US
and Japan.
Tuesday night saw special
forces troops encircling the
parliament building and army
helicopters hovering over it, but
the military withdrew after the
National Assembly unani-
mously voted to overturn the
decree, forcing Yoon to lift it
before daybreak Wednesday. 
The declaration of martial law
was the first of its kind in more
than 40 years in South Korea.
Eighteen lawmakers from the
ruling party voted to reject
Yoon’s martial law decree along
with opposition lawmakers.
Yoon’s speech fuelled specula-
tion that he and his party may
push for a constitutional
amendment to shorten his
term, instead of accepting
impeachment, as a way to ease
public anger over the marital
law and facilitate Yoon’s early
exit from office.
Lee Jae-myung, the leader of
the main liberal opposition
Democratic Party, told
reporters that Yoon’s speech
was “greatly disappointing”
and that the only way forward
is his immediate resignation or
impeachment. His party called
Yoon’s martial law “unconstitu-
tional, illegal rebellion or coup.”
The passage of Yoon’s impeach-
ment motion appeared more
likely Friday when the chair of
Yoon’s party called for his

removal on Friday, but the
party remained formally
opposed to impeachment.
On Saturday, tens of thou-
sands of people densely packed
several blocks of roads leading
up to the National Assembly,
waving banners, shouting slo-
gans and dancing and singing
along to K-pop songs with
lyrics changed to call for Yoon’s
ouster. Protesters also gathered
in front of PPP’s headquarters
near the Assembly, angrily
shouting for its lawmakers to
vote to impeach Yoon.
A smaller crowd of Yoon’s sup-
porters, which still seemed to
be in the thousands, rallied in

separate streets in Seoul, decry-
ing the impeachment attempt
they saw as unconstitutional.
Lawmakers on Saturday first
voted on a bill appointing a
special prosecutor to investigate
stock price manipulation alle-
gations surrounding Yoon’s
wife. Some lawmakers from
Yoon’s party were seen leaving
the hall after that vote, trigger-
ing angry shouts from opposi-
tion lawmakers.
On Friday, PPP chair Han
Dong-hun, who criticised
Yoon’s martial law declaration,
said he had received intelli-
gence that during the brief
period of martial law Yoon

ordered the country’s defence
counterintelligence comman-
der to arrest and detain unspec-
ified key politicians based on
accusations of “anti-state activ-
ities.”
Hong Jang-won, first deputy
director of South Korea’s
National Intelligence Service,
told lawmakers in a closed-
door briefing Friday that Yoon
had ordered him to help the
defence counterintelligence
unit to detain key politicians.
The targeted politicians includ-
ed Han, Lee and Woo, accord-
ing to Kim Byung-kee, one of
the lawmakers who attended
the meeting.

The Defence Ministry said
Friday it suspended three mil-
itary commanders including
the head of the defence coun-
terintelligence unit over their
involvement in enforcing mar-
tial law.
Vice Defence Minister Kim
Seon Ho has told parliament
that Defence Minister Kim
Yong Hyun ordered the deploy-
ment of troops to the National
Assembly after Yoon imposed
martial law. Opposition parties
accused Kim of recommending
to Yoon to enforce martial law.
Kim resigned Thursday, and
prosecutors imposed an over-
seas travel ban on him. 
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Afiery crash involving two
minibuses in Ivory Coast

on Friday killed at least 26 peo-
ple and injured 28 more,
authorities said.
The two vehicles collided in
Brokoua, a village in the cen-
tre west of the country, the
transportation ministry said
in a statement without provid-
ing further details. However,
the statement said an investiga-
tion was launched.
Ten of the 26 killed died in a
fire that followed the colli-
sion, according to the ministry.
Videos from the scene from
local media outlets showed the
two vehicles in flames.
“The Minister of Transport
invites, once again, all road
users to be more vigilant in
road traffic, by respecting traf-
fic regulations,” the statement
read. Accidents are common in
the west African country due to
dilapidated roads and reckless
driving, killing over 1,000 peo-
ple annually, according to the
ministry.
Last month, 21 people were
killed and at least 10 others
injured in a road accident.
Earlier this year, a tanker truck
crashed into a bus in northern
Ivory Coast, leaving 13 people
dead and injuring 44.

Iran poised to raise
stock of weapons-grade
Uranium: IAEA chief
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Iran is poised to “quite dra-
matically” increase its stock-

pile of near weapons-grade
uranium as it has started cas-
cades of advanced centrifuges,
the head of the International
Atomic Energy Agency warned
Friday. 
The comments from Rafael
Mariano Grossi came just
hours after Iran said it conduct-
ed a successful space launch
with its heaviest payload ever,
the latest for its programme
that the West alleges improves
Tehran’s ballistic missile pro-
gramme. 
The launch of the Simorgh
rocket comes as Iran’s nuclear
programme now enriches ura-
nium at 60%, a short, technical
step from weapons-grade lev-
els of 90%. While Iran main-
tains its programme is peace-
ful, officials in the Islamic
Republic increasingly threaten
to potentially seek the bomb
and an intercontinental ballis-
tic missile that would allow
Tehran to use the weapon
against distant foes like the

United States. 
The moves are likely to fur-
ther raise tensions gripping
the wider Middle East over
Israel’s continued war on
Hamas in the Gaza Strip and
as an uneasy ceasefire holds
in Lebanon. 
However, Iran may as well be
preparing the ground for pos-
sible talks with the incoming
administration of President-
elect Donald Trump, who in his
first term unilaterally with-
drew America from Tehran’s
nuclear deal with world pow-
ers.
The US intelligence communi-
ty in a report released Thursday
said that while “Iran is not
building a nuclear weapon” it
has “undertaken activities that
better position it to produce
one, if it so chooses.”
The Iranian debate over seek-
ing the bomb “risks embolden-
ing nuclear weapons advocates
within Iran’s decision-making
apparatus and shifting the
thinking of current and future
Iranian elites about the utility
of nuclear weapons,” the report
added.

NY cops push to identify CEO
killer, FBI offers reward
�
�� &�'�<,.+

The gunman who killed the CEO of the largest
US health insurer likely left New York City

on a bus soon after the brazen ambush that has
shaken corporate America, police officials said.
But he left something behind: a backpack that
was discovered in Central Park.
Nearly four days after the shooting of
UnitedHealthcare CEO Brian Thompson, police
still did not know the gunman’s name or
whereabouts or have a motive for the killing.
Investigators were looking at whether the
shooter may have been a disgruntled employ-
ee or client of the insurer, Chief of Detectives
Joseph Kenny told reporters.
The FBI announced Friday night it was offer-
ing a USD 50,000 reward for information lead-
ing to an arrest and conviction.
Video of the gunman fleeing Wednesday’s
shooting showed him riding a bicycle into
Central Park and later taking a taxi to a bus ter-
minal that offers commuter service to New Jersey
and Greyhound routes to Philadelphia, Boston
and Washington, D.C, according to Kenny.
Police have video of the man entering the bus
station but no video of him exiting, leading them
to believe he left the city, Kenny said.
Investigators on Friday found a backpack in the
park that had been worn by the gunman dur-
ing the shooting, police said, following a mas-
sive sweep to find it in a vast area with lakes and
ponds, meadows, playgrounds and woods.
Police didn’t immediately reveal what, if any-
thing, it contained but said it would be analyzed
for clues.
The gunman made sure to conceal his identity
with a mask during almost all of his time in the
city, including during the attack and while he
ate, yet left a trail of evidence in view of the
nation’s biggest city and its network of securi-
ty cameras.

The gunman arrived in New York City on Nov
24 and shot Thompson 10 days later outside his
company’s annual investor conference at a
hotel just blocks from Radio City Music Hall and
Rockefeller Center.
The gunman got off a bus that originated in
Atlanta and made several stops along the way,
Kenny said. Police have not determined where
he got on the bus. Investigators have a list of pas-
sengers, but none of them would have had to
provide an ID when they climbed aboard, Kenny
said.
Investigators believe the suspect used a fake iden-
tification card and paid cash, Kenny said,
when he checked in at the hostel, which has a
café along with shared and private rooms and
is blocks from Columbia University.
Investigators have tested a discarded water bot-
tle and protein bar wrapper in a hunt for his
DNA. They also were trying to obtain addition-
al information from a cellphone found along the
gunman’s escape route.
Photos of the suspected shooter that were taken
in the lobby of a hostel on Manhattan’s Upper
West Side appear to from the only time he
removed his mask, Kenny said. The images,
showing a man smiling in the lobby of the HI
New York City hostel. They are among a collec-
tion of photos and video circulated since the
shooting — including footage of the attack, as
well as images of the suspected gunman at a
Starbucks beforehand.
“From every indication we have from witness-
es, from the Starbucks, from the hostel, he kept
his mask on at all times except for the one
instance where we have him photographed with
the mask off,” Kenny said.
His roommates at the hostel also said he didn’t
speak to them. Nothing of investigative value was
found in a search of the suspected shooter’s hotel
room.
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The Syrian army withdrew
from much of southern

Syria on Saturday, leaving more
areas of the country, including
two provincial capitals, under
the control of opposition fight-
ers, the military and an oppo-
sition war monitor said.
The redeployment away from
the provinces of Daraa and

Sweida came as Syria’s military
sent large numbers of rein-
forcements to defend the key
central city of Homs, Syria’s
third largest, as insurgents
approached its outskirts.
The rapid advances by insur-
gents is a stunning reversal of
fortunes for Syria’s President
Bashar Assad, who appears to
be largely on his own, with erst-
while allies preoccupied with
other conflicts.
His chief international backer,
Russia, is busy with its war in

Ukraine, and Lebanon’s power-
ful Hezbollah, which at one
point sent thousands of fight-
ers to shore up his forces, has
been weakened by a yearlong
conflict with Israel. 
Iran, meanwhile, has seen its
proxies across the region
degraded by Israeli regular
airstrikes.
Rami Abdurrahman, who
heads the Syrian Observatory
for Human Rights, a Syria war
monitor, reported Saturday
that Iran’s military advisers

have started leaving Syria. He
added that Iran-backed fight-
ers in eastern Syria, mainly
from Afghanistan and Pakistan,
have withdrawn into central
Syria.
The shock offensive began
November 27 led by the jihadi
Hayat Tahrir al-Sham group, or
HTS, during which gunmen
captured the northern city of
Aleppo, Syria’s largest, and the
central city of Hama, the coun-
try’s fourth largest city. The
group has its origins in al-
Qaida and is considered a terror-
ist organisation by the US and
the United Nations.
HTS leader Abu Mohammed al-
Golani told CNN in an exclusive
interview Thursday from Syria
that the aim of the offensive is
to overthrow Assad’s govern-
ment.
The Britain-based Observatory
said Syrian troops have with-
drawn from much of the two
southern provinces and are

sending reinforcements to
Homs, where a battle is looming.
If the insurgents capture Homs,
they would cut the link between
Damascus, Assad’s seat of power,
and the coastal region where the
president enjoys wide support.
The Syrian army said in a state-
ment Saturday that it has carried
out redeployment and reposi-
tioning in Sweida and Daraa
after its checkpoints came under
attack by “terrorists.” The army
said it is setting up a “strong and
coherent defensive and securi-
ty belt in the area,” apparently to
defend Damascus from the
south. Since Syria’s conflict broke
out in March 2011, the Syrian
government has been referring
to opposition gunmen as terror-
ists. In the gas-rich nation of
Qatar, the foreign ministers of
Iran, Russia and Turkey were
scheduled to meet to discuss the
situation in Syria. Turkey is a
main backer of the rebels seek-
ing to overthrow Assad.
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England led New Zealand by
533 runs with five second-

innings wickets in hand
Saturday after another day of
extraordinary incidents and
milestones, including a hat-
trick on the second day of the
second test at the Basin
Reserve.
At stumps, England was 378-

5 in its second innings with Joe
Root 73 not out and captain
Ben Stokes unbeaten on 35.
Root was among the history-

makers Saturday, reaching his
100th score of 50 or more in
tests. When he reached his 65th
half century, which goes along
with his 35 centuries, he
became the fourth player after
Sachin Tendulkar, Jacques
Kallis and Ricky Ponting to
achieve that feat.
When Stokes declares, possi-

bly overnight, New Zealand
will have to achieve the high-
est successful fourth-innings
run chase in test history to win
the match and level the three-
match series. England won the
first test by eight wickets in
Christchurch.  The record suc-
cessful fourth innings total
currently sits at 418, achieved
by the West Indies against
Australia at St. John's in the
Caribbean 21 years ago.

Under any normal circum-

stances, Stokes probably would
have been happy to declare by
now, confident in his bowlers'
ability to defend such a mam-
moth lead.
But the match has progressed
so fast and so far with 783 runs
being scored and 25 wickets
falling on the first two days,
that three full days are still
available to New Zealand reach
its winning target. Most other
winning fourth-innings totals
in tests have had some element
of a time constraint.
The pitch at the Basin Reserve
which has been bathed in sun-
shine on the first two days also
is becoming more docile.
Stokes came to the crease 30

minutes before stumps
Saturday and immediately hit
a four and a six in the first over
he faced from Matt Henry,
then another six in what
seemed a tacit announcement
of an impending declaration.
By declaring overnight, Stokes
will allow the England bowlers
to rest and start fresh on the
third day.
The England second innings

also saw two batters fall in the
90s, Jacob Bethell on 96, just
short of his maiden test centu-
ry, and Ben Duckett on 92.
Harry Brook made 55 to go
with his 123 in the first innings
and his 171 in the first innings
of the first test.
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The Merseyside derby
between Everton and

Liverpool was postponed on
Saturday because of Storm
Darragh, which brought
dangerous winds and rain to
the west coast.
The Premier League match
was due to kick off at 12.30
p.M. U.K. Time, but Everton
issued a statement in the
morning to say it would not
go ahead.

The Met office said parts of
Wales had experienced wind
gusts of over 90 mph.
“Storm Darragh continues to
bring strong winds across the
UK, with red, amber and
yellow wind warnings in
force,” the office said on social
media.
Aston Villa will host
Southampton in a 3 p.M.
Kickoff. The team urged fans
to use extra time to get to
Villa Park in Birmingham.
“We want to advise all

supporters to allow extra time
for travel to today's game due
to poor weather conditions
across the country. Please take
extra care and stay safe. We
look forward to seeing you at
the game,” the team said in a
statement.
Three other games were
scheduled in the Premier
League on Saturday.
Manchester United was
hosting Nottingham Forest at
5:30 p.M. Local time. United
has not commented on the

storm.
In London, Brentford was
hosting Newcastle, and
Crystal Palace was hosting
Manchester City. Both games
are at 3 p.M.
Brentford and Palace both
said their games will be
played.
“Today's match is still
scheduled to go ahead despite
the bad weather,” Brentford
said. “Please travel safely, plan
ahead, and allow extra time
for your journey.”
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Adesperate India will
need their under-fire

batters to step up in the
second Women's ODI
against Australia here on
Sunday, as the visitors aim to
avoid yet another series loss
Down Under.

India's batting woes
continued as the tourists
were bundled out for 100 in
the series opener, leading to
a demoralising five-wicket
defeat, their heaviest in
terms of balls remaining
since ODIs were reduced to
50 overs a side.

India have never won a
series Down Under and they
will have their task cut out
against a quality Australian
side, which showed no signs
of rust despite playing in the
format after a gap of nine
months.
On the other hand, it was

the Indians who appeared
under-prepared as the squad

was unable to train together
as some of the players were
competing in domestic T20
tournaments while others
played in the Women's Big
Bash League.

Additionally, one of their
two practice sessions here
was washed out due to rain.

After opting to bat, the
Indian batters were unable
to capitalise on good batting
conditions. 
They lost wickets at regular
intervals, were unable to
stitch partnerships, and were
done in by Megan Schutt's
brilliant spell with the new
ball.
"We were expecting a good

score if our batters had
applied themselves better. If
we had more runs on the
scoreboard, anything could
have happened." India coach
Amol Muzumdar conceded
after the match.

With the batting
inconsistencies continuing
from the New Zealand

series, time is running out
for India, who will host the
ODI Wold Cup next year.
The Indian think tank will

be keen to stabilise their
batting and bowling line-
up ahead of the marquee
event.

Even though the bowlers
had a small target to defend,
they did well to pick five
wickets. The only silver
lining in an otherwise
forgettable outing for India
was pacer Renuka Thakur
and young leg-spinner Priya
Mishra.

The tourists will have to
regroup fast and having
already played a game here,
they will hope to give a
better account of
themselves.
"The major thing we talked

about was that one match
doesn't make you a good
team or a bad team. We
played a match and it did
not go our way. It's fine, we'll
take a step back and evaluate

what we could have done
better. We have played some
good cricket this year we
will take it from there.
"The conditions are a little

different then we are used to
but we will be able to adjust
to it," pacer Titas Sadhu said
on the eve of the second
ODI.

Meanwhile, Australia
produced an almost flawless
performance despite missing
regular skipper Alyssa
Healy.

Veteran pacer Schutt
registered career-best
figures of 5/19 before young
opener Georgia Voll
impressed on debut.

Australia will be keen on
putting up a similar display
to seal another series win
against India but the hosts
are unlikely to take
Harmanpreet Kaur and Co
lightly.

"India cannot be
underestimated and we will
not make the mistake of

being complacent. I think
the Indian batsmen will
come back strongly in the
next match but I have
worked a lot on my bowling
and I hope to maintain this
rhythm,"she had said after
the first match," Schutt had
said after the opener.
Teams (from):
India: Harmanpreet Kaur

(c), Smriti Mandhana (vc),
Priya Punia, Jemimah
Rodrigues, Harleen Deol,
Uma Chetry, Richa Ghosh
(wk), Tejal Hasabnis, Deepti
Sharma, Minnu Mani, Priya
Mishra, Radha Yadav, Titas
Sadhu, Arundhati Reddy,
Renuka Singh Thakur,
Saima Thakor

Australia: Tahlia McGrath
(c), Ashleigh Gardner (vc),
Darcie Brown, Kim Garth,
Alana King, Phoebe
Litchfield, Sophie Molineux,
Beth Mooney, Ellyse Perry,
Megan Schutt, Annabel
Sutherland, Georgia Voll,
Georgia Wareham

Focus on batting as demoralised India look to avoid series defeat against Aus
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Travis Head continued to
be a thorn in India's flesh

with a counterattacking 141-
ball 140 and powered
Australia to a dominant 332
for eight at dinner on the
second day of the pink ball
Test here on Saturday.

Thanks to Head's eighth
Test century, which he
reached in 111 balls after
toying with India's
formidable bowling attack,
Australia have taken a 152-
run first innings lead as they
looked to restore parity in
the five-match series after
the 295-run hammering in
the opener at Perth.
Head, who got off the mark

with a cracking boundary
off Jasprit Bumrah (4/59),
got a reprieve on 76 as
Mohammed Siraj failed to
complete the catch despite
getting both hands to it after
the batter tried to slog-
sweep R Ashwin, having just
smashed his third six against
the off-spinner.
Amid the rejoicing around

Head's century at the
Adelaide Oval, Siraj was
rewarded for his discipline
as he had Alex Carey caught
behind following a faint
outside edge with Australia's
lead crossing 100.

Desperate to prevent
Australia from swelling their
lead further, India took the
second new ball the moment
it was made available to
them, and their lead pacer
Bumrah too was brought
back into the attack. 
Bumrah, however, pulled up

and was seen holding his
adductor muscle as the
physio attended to him.
Fortunately for India,
Bumrah was up on his feet
quickly and ready to bowl
again, even as Head flicked
him for two boundaries in
between. 

During his knock, Head
played some incredible
shots, including a pick-up

six over Siraj over deep
square leg, but the pacer had
the last laugh as he brought
his innings to an end when
he cleaned him up with a
yorker.
In all, Head struck 17 fours

and four sixes. 
Earlier, Rohit Sharma giving
his strike bowler Bumrah
only four overs in the first
session was a bit strange,
and so were some of his field
placements. Then, in
another surprising move, he
started the proceedings after
tea with Ravichandran
Ashwin instead of the fast
bowlers.

Luck, though, was with
Ashwin as Mitchell Marsh

decided to walk off despite
an half-baked appeal by the
Indian team.
Seeing Marsh heading in the
direction of the dressing
room, Richard Illingworth
raised his finger too, but
replays clearly showed there
was a gap between bat and
pad. 

Unperturbed by all these,
Head went about his task in
the manner he does best --
dictating the terms to the
bowlers with his free-
flowing strokes.
None of the Indian bowlers,

including Bumrah, looked
like they could cause
problems for Head. 

Straight after tea, the
aggressive left-hander
employed a late cut against
Bumrah to send the ball in
the gap between gully and
backward point. And he
continued in same vein until
he was dismissed. 

This was after Marnus
Labuschagne regained form
with a composed half-
century.

Labuschagne (64), whose
place in the team was
debated prior to this game
owing to his prolonged lean
run with the bat, registered
his 26th half-century and
then launched himself into a
flurry of boundaries in what

were worrying signs for
India. 

But promising all-rounder
Nitish Reddy cut short
Labuschagne's innings as the
batter tried to guide him
through gully only for
Yashasvi Jaiswal to hold on
to the sharp catch.
Looking to fight their way

back into the game after
Australia's dominance on
the opening day, India got
an early breakthrough
through who else but
Bumrah.
Playing in only his second

Test after a forgettable debut
in Perth, Nathan
McSweeney had no answer
to one of many excellent
deliveries from Bumrah,
which straightened a
fraction after landing on the
perfect length and all the
batter could do was get a
little nick while trying to
defend after getting stuck on
the crease.

Steve Smith's poor run of
form continued as the
former captain got out in the
most unfortunate fashion.
Smith looked to flick a
Bumrah delivery tickling
down the leg side but only
ended up edging it to the
keeper Rishabh Pant who
completed a neat catch
diving to his left. 
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Tamil Nadu Dragons Dutch
head coach Rein Van Eijk

believes Olympic-medal
winning India defender Amit
Rohidas is the best "first
rusher" in the world and
hopes his multiple skills will
benefit the franchise in the
upcoming revamped Hockey
India League (HIL). 

Two-time Olympic bronze
medallist, Rohidas is one of
the best first rushers in the
world when it comes to
defending penalty corners. As
if that was not enough, the
player from Odisha is also a
potent dragflicker and a
senior member of the Indian
men's team. 

"For us, getting Amit
(Rohidas) was obviously the
one thing that we wished for.
He's the number one rusher
in the world and a warrior in
his style of play. He defends
and leads by action, which
will be a great motivation for
the team. He is able to play
multiple positions, can also
dragflick," Van Eijk told PTI
video in an exclusive
interview.

Rohidas has 200
international caps to his
credit and has scored more

than 25 goals. 
Rohidas will be

complemented by Paris
Olympics silver medalist
Moritz Ludwig of Germany,
another elite rusher, ensuring
a solid defence for Tamil
Nadu Dragons from set
pieces. 

"I think there are four top
rushers in the world.
Obviously, Amit Rohidas is
probably the number one of
those four, but Moritz
Ludwig, the German player
that we've gotten, is in the top
four as well. So our corner
defense should be very solid,"
said Van Eijk, coach of
Germany's 2023 Under-21
World Cup-winning side.

The coach reserved special

praise for young India striker
and Tamil Nadu player Karthi
Selvam. 
"With Karthi, we have a very

talented forward. His
performances in the 2022
Asia Cup and Asian
Champions Trophy showed
his strength. His goal-scoring
ability and explosiveness
bring all the good. He's also
physically very imposing and
very strong on the ball. 
"I think scoring nine goals in

the game where they won 43-
0 with the Tamil Nadu hockey
unit says a lot about his
qualities. I hope that this can
be his way back into the
Indian men's national team to
solidify his spot," Van Eijk
said. 
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Milestones galore as England
leads New Zealand by 533 runs
in the 2nd test after 2 days
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After nearly three years, Yeh
Kaali Kaali Ankhein makes
its much-anticipated return

to Netflix with Season 2. Directed
by Sidharth Sengupta, the web
series brings back its gripping
narrative style while aiming to
keep the audience engaged with a
fresh dose of action. The cast
features Tahir Raj Bhasin, Shweta
Tripathi, and Anchal Singh in the
lead roles, supported by notable
performances from Saurabh
Shukla, Surya Sharma, and
Arunoday Singh.
The second season picks up right
where the first left off, resuming
the suspenseful narrative with the
abduction of Purva, played by
Anchal Singh. The creators have
consciously tried to maintain the
series’ intensity, diving straight
into the action from the first
episode. This decision sets a fast-
paced tone that remains consistent
throughout the season.
While the relentless action
sequences and tightly woven plot
aim to fascinate the audience, the
series struggles to break new
ground. While effective in parts,
the continuous focus on action
begins to feel repetitive, causing
the narrative to lose the unique
spark that made the first season
stand out. Despite the attempt to

maintain the thrill, the over-
reliance on similar storytelling
techniques limits its ability to
surprise and entertain viewers
fully.
The cast of Yeh Kaali Kaali
Ankhein Season 2 brings their
characters to life with relentless
dedication, providing the primary
reason for viewers to stay invested
in the series. Arunoday Singh

delivers a compelling performance
as the contract killer Aditya
Hafeez, embodying a skilled
kidnapper’s intense and menacing
aura with his brooding demeanor
and serious expressions. His
portrayal is both convincing and
impactful, adding a layer of depth

to the narrative.
Tahir Raj Bhasin once again shines
as Vikrant Singh Chauhan, the
tormented protagonist at the heart
of the story. Bhasin’s performance
is an example of his remarkable
acting prowess, as he portrays
Vikrant’s inner turmoil and

determination with precision. His
serious and gritty portrayal further
solidifies his reputation as a
versatile actor capable of
commanding attention with every
scene.
Shweta Tripathi returns as Sikha,
the love interest of Vikrant,

although her role is noticeably
reduced in this season. Despite her
limited screen time, Tripathi
ensures that her presence is felt in
all the key moments. The
character’s development takes an
unexpected turn as Sikha finds
herself married to a new police
officer, adding an intriguing layer
to the storyline.
A notable new addition to the cast
is Gurmeet Choudhary, whose
performance as Guru, a close
friend of Purva, makes an
immediate impression.
Choudhary makes out a distinctive
space for himself in the series,
bringing a fresh dynamic to the
plot. His character’s arrival stirs up

the narrative, introducing a sense
of unpredictability and piquing the
audience’s curiosity about the
unfolding events.
While the show’s thrilling plot and
dramatic twists may resonate with
a general audience, it may fall
short of expectations for ardent
crime and thriller enthusiasts. The
plot, while engaging in parts, tends
to feel stretched as it goes into
repetitive themes, leaving the story
feeling somewhat incomplete.
Despite these shortcomings, the
series manages to sustain interest,
largely due to its talented cast and
their performances.

RATING: 3/5

Fashion is a language, a story told
through fabric and beads, a
canvas that speaks of cultures
and dreams. When Suneet
Varma takes the stage, the fabric
transforms into poetry. His latest
collection, Quetzalli, unveiled in

collaboration with PATRÓN Tequila, is a
masterpiece that bridges continents, blending
the fiery soul of Mexico with the intricate
elegance of Indian couture. The evening
sparkled with sophistication at The Upper
House by Tivoli as Varma’s designs graced the
runway. Each model brought the audience
into a world where tradition and innovation
existed side by side. The inspiration? A
journey to the legendary Hacienda PATRÓN
in Jalisco, Mexico, where tequila is an art
form in itself. Quetzalli emerged not as a
tribute to tequila but to the shared spirit of
meticulous craftsmanship that defines both
cultures.
The collection redefined the colour black,
giving it depth, allure and richness. Sheer
black gowns adorned with intricate
lacework were delicately touched with
hints of gold that shimmered under the
lights, like secrets waiting to be
discovered. These weren’t just clothes;
they were symbols of confidence,
elegance, and a celebration of
womanhood. Accessories played a
crucial role, with statement
necklaces gleaming in antique
gold and belts cinching the
waistlines of capes and gowns,
adding structure to the
delicate. Ornate headpieces
gave the models an almost
regal aura, transforming
the runway into a scene of
modern-day queens.
Suneet Varma’s artistry
lies in storytelling. In
Quetzalli, lace

r e p r e s e n t e d
Mexico’s ancient

traditions, while
e m b r o i d e r y

t e c h n i q u e s
s h o w c a s e d
I n d i a ’ s

u n p a r a l l e l e d
craftsmanship. The

silhouettes flowed effortlessly, structured yet
soft, tailored yet fluid. From tiered skirts with
voluminous ruffles reminiscent of traditional
Mexican dresses to contemporary separates
designed for the modern woman, the
collection was versatile, sensual and
unmistakably Suneet. Silver, drawing
inspiration from PATRÓN’s meticulous
tequila-making process, starting with hand-
harvested Weber Blue Agave and crafting
exceptional varieties like Silver, Reposado,
Añejo and the ultra-premium El Cielo, was
used to add a touch of refinement and
sophistication to the pieces. Sheer capes
adorned with metallic motifs floated behind
models, reflecting the mystical energy of the
Quetzal bird, after which the collection is
named.
The collection also celebrated the art of
working with feathers in Mexico, known as
plumería. This technique, highly valued in
pre-Hispanic and colonial Mexico, was
reflected in the dramatic feather details seen
on some pieces in the collection. Suneet
Varma’s use of this ancient art form was a

reflection of his respect for both
Mexican heritage and the
craftsmanship behind each
element of his designs. The feather
details were used not just as
decoration but as an integral part
of the concept, evoking the
elegance and mysticism of
Mexico’s rich history.
Varma’s designs aren’t limited by
time or trends, they are
experiences. Quetzalli is for the
woman who wants to walk into a
room and own it. Whether it’s
an evening gala, an intimate
dinner, or a rooftop soiree,
these pieces make the wearer
the focus without needing to
speak. The grand finale
brought the audience to its
feet as the designer himself
took a bow amidst applause.
Dressed impeccably, Suneet
Varma acknowledged the
partnership that made Quetzalli
possible. It wasn’t just fashion; it
was a celebration of how heritage
can evolve and adapt without
losing its essence.
Fashion is more than just
clothes, it’s a way of life. Quetzalli
captures this ethos, blending two
cultures while staying true to artistry. It’s
about reimagining tradition, embracing
innovation, and celebrating the craftspeople
who bring every stitch and bead to life. As the
night ended, the buzz in the air was filled with
admiration for Varma’s genius and the
journey of Quetzalli. In the hands of Suneet
Varma, fabric becomes a storyteller and
Quetzalli tells a tale that stays with you long
after the runway lights dim. For now, it’s not
just a collection; it’s a legacy waiting to be
adorned.
Suneet Varma says, “This collaboration with
PATRÓN Tequila brings together our shared
passion for artistry and heritage. The
Quetzalli collection reflects a fusion of
refined couture and Mexico’s rich culture,
honoring both PATRÓN’s craftsmanship and
my vision for elegance."
¡Viva la moda, viva la herencia!

PHOTOS : PANKAJ KUMAR
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food 09“FOOD IS SYMBOLIC OF LOVE 
WHEN WORDS ARE INADEQUATE” 

—  ALAN D. WOLFELT
Chandigarh, December 8, 2024

When it comes to coffee culture, First
Coffee has always been a name
synonymous with quality, creativity

and bold flavours. Co-founded by the dynamic
trio of Sohrab Sitaram, Shiv Dhawan and
Chandini D Purnesh, this café has been a
favourite haunt for caffeine enthusiasts and
foodies alike. Their latest revamped menu is
here to take your coffee and snack experience
to the next level. Packed with innovative
offerings, trendy beverages and classic
delights, the menu is designed to cater to every
palate. Whether you’re a matcha enthusiast, a
fan of indulgent pastries or someone who
loves a good sandwich or wrap, First Coffee has
you covered.
COFFEE, COMFORT AND
CONVERSATIONS: First Coffee’s interiors
feel like a warm hug. With cosy seating,
soothing earthy tones and the irresistible
aroma of freshly brewed coffee, the café offers
the perfect setting for everything from a quick
catch-up to a leisurely workday. The ambience
strikes a delicate balance between modern
design and laid-back charm, making it a space
you’ll want to stay in.
TRENDY SIPS: THE MATCHA LATTE
Among the highlights of the new menu is the
Matcha Latte, a drink that’s as vibrant as it is
intriguing. Known for its earthy, slightly grassy

flavour, matcha has become a favourite among
those looking for a trendy yet healthy
alternative. While it might take some getting
used to for first-timers, it’s a sip worth
acquiring. First Coffee’s version offers a creamy,
balanced taste that pairs beautifully with
savoury bites like the paneer tikka sandwich or
the chickpea Veggie wrap. 
NEVER GO OUT OF STYLE: As much as
First Coffee excels in innovation, they also
understand the value of keeping things classic.
Their Classic Iced Coffee remains a
cornerstone of the menu, offering a refreshing
pick-me-up that’s as dependable as it is
delicious. Perfectly brewed and served chilled,
it’s a reminder of why First Coffee became a
beloved name in the first place.
SWEET DREAMS IN EVERY BITE: Sweet
tooth? You’re in for a treat. The new menu
introduces the incredible range of pastries.
First up is the freshly baked Choco-Berry
Dream Doughnut, a decadent creation that
combines the richness of chocolate and
custard with a fresh twist of blueberry jam and
shaved chocolate on top. If you’re a fan of
chocolate, the Choco Truffle Eclairs are not to
be missed. They combine deep, indulgent
chocolate flavours with just the right amount

of berry sweetness, making them
the perfect treat for anyone with
a sweet tooth. For something a bit
more adventurous, the Blueberry
Passion Eclairs and the Nutella
Cinnamon Roll are a must-try. The
cinnamon roll, in particular, is
topped with marshmallows and
toasted seeds, adding extra texture
and sweetness to every bite.
SAVOURY DELIGHTS: The
savoury offerings on the menu are
just as impressive. The Truffle
Mushroom Sandwich is a
symphony of flavours, combining
truffled mushrooms, caramelised onions and
gooey cheese. It’s rich, satisfying, and
indulgent. For a spicier kick, the Chipotle
Veggie Sandwich features Mexican-inspired
vegetables and melted cheese layered on
hearty Italian bread.
Wrap lovers will adore the Chickpea Veggie
Wrap, a flavour-packed burrito-style wrap
filled with spicy chickpeas, and tangy pickled
onions. Pair it with a side of their crispy
Classic Fries for a meal that’s as comforting as
it is filling.
SWEET AND SAVOURY PAIRINGS: The
new menu is designed with pairings in mind,
offering a curated experience that
complements every dish. Enjoy their signature
Crunchy Hazelnut Smash for a heavenly mix
of chocolatey sweetness and nutty richness.
Or, pair the bold Flaky Chicken Seekh Wrap
with a soothing Ginger Tea and Masala tea for
a balance of spice and warmth.

If you’re in the mood to
experiment, the Cascara

Thunder, a refreshing mix of
cascara syrup over ice and

lemonade, offers a zesty
complement to the bold

flavours of wraps. Each
pairing has been thoughtfully
created to elevate your dining
experience.
DESSERTS AND SIDES
THAT DELIGHT: First
Coffee has also introduced
indulgent sides and desserts

that are worth savouring.
The Korean BBQ Potato and Chicken Poppers
are perfect companions to their wraps and
sandwiches, while the Brookie, a fusion of
brownie and cookie, is a dessert dream come
true.
WHY YOU’LL LOVE IT: First Coffee’s new
menu blends trendy offerings like the Matcha
Latte with timeless classics like the Iced
Coffee, creating a menu that caters to every
taste and preference. Add in the cosy,
welcoming ambience and you have a café that’s
more than just a place to grab a coffee, it’s a
destination.

My friends have been dedicated patrons of
Kashmirana, a Kashmiri restaurant nestled
in Rodeo Drive that’s gained a steady
following in its five years. They’ve shared
their experiences numerous times, so I was

eager to see what the buzz was about on my first visit.
Kashmirana has a cosy vibe with a mix of comfortable table
seating and a few low tables for those looking to linger. My
wife aptly described the interiors as reminiscent of a
houseboat’s warmth and charm.
We found ourselves indulging in a variety of dishes, given
her vegetarian preference. In the non-vegetarian starters,
the Tabakmaaz and mutton seekh kebabs were both
outstanding. The Tabakmaaz had that perfect crispiness,
yielding to the fatty richness inside, while the mutton seekh
had a delicate, hollow centre that retained a satisfying bite -
some of the juiciest I’ve had in Gurgaon. My wife, on the
other hand, enjoyed the lotus root fritters (nadru chips), cut
into long, crispy strips and coated with a flavourful,
addictive spice blend.
In the mains, the rista and goshtaba were delightful, with
the same signature spongy meatballs but distinct gravies
that made each dish memorable. I prefer bigger balls but
these tasted as good. On the vegetarian side, the haaq,
rajma, and nadru yakhani shone brightly, leaving us no
choice but to pack up the leftovers - vegetarian for us and
non-vegetarian for my friends. And if I say we loved the
non-veg, it’s only fair to note the vegetarian options were no
less satisfying.
Traditional brassware enhanced the authenticity of the
experience, and the kehwa added an extra layer of warmth,
perfect for the season. Though the phirni was good, I’ve had
more refined versions. However, the dry fruit-laden shufta,
cooked in desi ghee, was a decadent finale.
Kashmirana’s portions are ample, the pricing fair, and the
food impressive, especially as the restaurant filled with
fellow Kashmiris as we dined, a clear testament to its
authenticity and popularity among those who truly know
this cuisine.

When one thinks of India’s diverse
culinary landscape, it’s easy to be
drawn to the well-known dishes of the

north or the spicy delights of the south. But
what about the understated flavours of Odisha?
Often overshadowed by its more famous
counterparts, Odisha’s cuisine is a hidden gem,
rich in taste and steeped in tradition. The recent
Odia pop-up at Chor Bizarre, the iconic Asaf Ali
Road, New Delhi restaurant, offered a rare
opportunity to experience the unique
vegetarian dishes of Odisha, expertly curated by
actor-filmmaker Nandita Das and her culinary
collaborator Mona Lisa Bal.
The event was an exciting foray into the lesser-
known corners of Indian cuisine, offering an
authentic glimpse into the simple yet bold
flavours of Odisha. With the restaurant’s long-
standing reputation for bringing regional Indian
cuisines to the forefront, this pop-up felt like a
welcome celebration of the state’s rich culinary
heritage, especially for those in New Delhi who
may not have had the chance to explore it.
The carefully crafted vegetarian menu
showcased the simplicity and brilliance
of Odia cuisine. The meal began
with “Ghole Dahi” (Odia Chhas), a
traditional yogurt-based drink
that was both refreshing
and tangy, setting the tone
for the meal ahead. It was
the perfect introduction
to a menu that relied on
fresh, local ingredients and a
delicate balance of spices.
The starters were a real treat, with
dishes like “Biri Boda with Dhaniya
Chutney” (Lentil Fritters with Coriander) and
“Besara Chhatu Potra Poda” (Mushrooms with
Mustard in Banana Leaf) capturing the essence
of Odisha’s cooking style. The lentil fritters were
crispy on the outside, soft on the inside, and
paired beautifully with a fresh coriander
chutney that added a burst of flavour. The
mushrooms, cooked with mustard and wrapped
in banana leaves, offered a smoky, earthy flavour
that exemplified the depth of Odia culinary
techniques.
When it came to the main courses, the dishes
truly shone. “Dahi Baingan” (Shallow Fried
Eggplant with Tempered Yogurt) was a
standout, with its crisp, golden eggplant and
creamy, tangy yogurt creating a delicious
contrast in texture and taste. “Dalma,” a hearty
lentil and vegetable stew with coconut, was a
comforting dish, light yet full of flavour. The

addition of “Kusala Saaga” (Amaranth Leaves
with Garlic) and “Santula” (Sautéed Vegetables
with Five Spices) further exemplified the
region’s love for vegetables, bringing out the
freshness and natural taste of the ingredients in
every bite.
The accompaniments were the perfect
complements to the main dishes. “Chakuli Pita,”
a soft, chewy flatbread made with lentils and
rice, was ideal for scooping up curries, while the
steamed “Bhaata” (rice) acted as a neutral base
to balance the complex spices.
No meal would be complete without dessert,
and Chor Bizarre didn’t disappoint. “Kheer

Sagar” (Chhena Balls in Thickened
Milk) offered a rich and creamy

end to the meal, while “Chhena
Podo,” a baked chhena

dessert, had a beautiful
caramelised flavour that
left a lasting impression.
The vegetarian menu
was, without a doubt, the

star of the pop-up.
However, it’s worth noting

that the non-vegetarian thali
also garnered rave reviews, with

guests praising its perfect blend of spices and
execution. Chor Bizarre’s ability to balance both
vegetarian and non-vegetarian offerings with
such precision only further cements its
reputation as a destination for authentic
regional cuisine.
The Odia pop-up at Chor Bizarre was an
enlightening and flavoursome journey into the
heart of Odisha’s culinary culture. For those
who have yet to explore the delights of Odia
cuisine, this pop-up provided a rare and
memorable experience, showcasing the
region’s unique approach to vegetarian dishes
that are as healthy as they are flavourful. With
its emphasis on fresh ingredients, simple yet
creative preparations, and a deep respect for
tradition, this pop-up was a celebration of the
incredible variety India’s regional cuisines
have to offer.
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Pawan Soni 
Food critic and
founder of the 
Big F Awards

The
Art of Authentic
Kashmiri Dining

Kashmirana serves authentic Kashmiri food with a cosy
setting, bringing the flavours of Kashmir to Gurugram

The Heart of
Odisha’s Cuisine

Chor Bizarre’s Odia pop-up brings an authentic, unique
taste of Odisha, writes TEAM AGENDA

RATINGS (Out of 5):
FOOD: 4.0 | AMBIENCE: 3.75 |
SERVICE: 4.0 | OVERALL: 4.0

ADDRESS: KASHMIRANA, 1ST FLOOR, RODEO DRIVE, SECTOR 49, GURUGRAM | PHONE: 85953 99049

First Coffee’s revamped menu combines
innovative flavours, trendy beverages and classic
favourites, creating the perfect coffee and snack

experience, writes TEAM AGENDA

More
Than Just
a Coffee !

Left to right - Culinary Collaborator Mona Lisa Bal, Chef Srinivasulu. A and Actor & Filmmaker Nandita Das

Co Founders : Sohrab Sitaram and Shiv Dhawan 

F A C T  S H E E T
LOCATIONS:

Cyberhub, Gurugram
Pacific Mall, Jasola
Pacific Mall, NSP
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"It is in literature that the
concrete outlook of humanity

receives its expression"
– Alfred North Whitehead

It is a paradox of sorts: while people’s
reading habits are at an all-time low, there is
a flood of writers producing content on
virtually every subject. From fiction and
non-fiction to cookbooks and travelogues,

the book market is booming like never before.
The Indian publishing industry was valued at
approximately INR 500 billion in 2019, with
projections indicating growth to INR 800 billion
by 2024. This sector significantly contributes to
India’s economic development, fostering learning,
education, and employment for over 1.2 million
people.
Recent reports suggest that the industry is
expanding at a compound annual growth rate
(CAGR) of around 19.4%, with some estimates as
high as 25%. This growth is particularly notable
in the printbook market, which is anticipated to
see substantial increases in value. Educational
books dominate the sector, while the increasing
adoption of eBooks and digital content is
transforming the industry. Despite a decline in
print publishing revenues due to shifting
consumer preferences towards online books,
magazines, and newspapers, the combined
revenue from print and digital publishing
continues to grow, illustrating that publishing as a
whole is not in decline.
India has approximately 19,000 publishers. The
publishing industry in India is vibrant but
scattered, with no single association having more
than 1,000 members. Evaluating publishers can
be challenging, as it involves considering factors
such as market size, reputation, genres covered,
and influence on the literary landscape. Among
the prominent names in Indian publishing,
Penguin Random House India stands out as a
major player, recognised for its diverse portfolio,
literary excellence, and global reach. It publishes
celebrated authors such as Arundhati Roy and
Salman Rushdie, establishing itself as a giant in
the industry.
HarperCollins India, established in 1992, is
another notable publisher with a strong presence
across genres, including fiction, self-help, and
business books. It is home to renowned authors
like Amitav Ghosh, Chetan Bhagat, and Paulo
Coelho. Rupa Publications, one of India’s oldest
and most respected publishers, specialises in
Indian fiction, biographies, and academic works,
with imprints such as Rupa, Oak, and
Fingerprint.
Bloomsbury India launched in 2002, has also
made a mark in the industry with its high-quality
literary fiction, non-fiction, children’s books, and
academic texts. Together, these publishers play a
vital role in shaping India’s literary landscape and
catering to the evolving preferences of readers.
But when it comes to writers it is another story.
Given the size of the country, even a small
percentage of people trying their hand in writing
becomes large in absolute terms. However, not all
are equally talented or taught. Of course,
creativity cannot be taught in school, but style
and form can be. With very few institutions that
hone the craft of writing the writing suffers and
only a handful of writers stand out in the ocean
of mediocrity.
Of course, Books cannot be strictly categorised as
good or bad; they are simply those you cherish
and those you don’t. Some books resonate deeply,
while others leave you wondering who they were
written for. Even so, labelling a book as ‘bad’ feels
unfair; what one dislikes might be perfect for
someone with different tastes or standards. But
having said that it is also true some books leave a
bad taste in the mouth for almost all.
Though the number of writers is swelling, which
is indeed a good thing that cannot be said about
the quality of books written by them. There is a

growing trend among new Indian authors to just
write and have a book under their name. This is
perhaps more true of writers writing in English
than in other Indian languages.  Many recent
books feel amateurish and hastily written.  It’s
frustrating to see many careless writings being
passed off as literature, leaving readers feeling
duped.
Many books are being churned out with similar
themes as if other streams have dried up — ala
Bollywood which tends to produce similar films
after a blockbuster, hoping to cash in on the
success. Others who experiment often end up
with juvenile themes and shallow characters. It
seems the trend began with the overwhelming
success of Chetan Bhagat. While Bhagat’s book
was light and entertaining, its success led many
aspiring writers to believe they could replicate his
formula without effort—by simply injecting
Bollywood-like clichés into their stories.
Many times writers succumb to commercial
temptations, trying to publish which would get
them a filmmaker like Slumdog Millionaire after
the film adaptation’s Oscar triumph. Thus, we
have a trend: literature crafted to satisfy a
superficial public demand, rather than to
challenge or inspire.
No doubt publishing is a business like any other
and must make a profit. It also has to compete
with the reader’s attention span of human
goldfish- the GenZ. But that often comes with a
big price tag. Where are the bold, thoughtful
voices of Indian literature? Where are the Salman
Rushdies, Amitav Ghoshes, R.K. Narayan, and
Anita Desais of today? Literature thrives on
diversity, but the current scene of Indian writing
in English seems weighed down by opportunists
chasing fame over craft.  And make no mistake
this trend is here to stay. It is all over -- visible in
the literature festivals even in the reputed ones.

As they say, it is easy to write a book but
difficult to make a person read it. To
make it readable it needs to be worth

the time and effort of the reader – give him or
her some insights, information or perspective
he didn’t have or make him laugh or cry if
that is intended. Translating thoughts into
words is an art that deserves to be approached
with seriousness. To do so, one must often
seclude themselves, almost in a spiritual sense,
and dedicate their focus to the act of writing.
Writing retreats are an excellent opportunity
to refine your skills, learn the ropes, and gain
insight into the publishing industry. Mentors,
often editors from the industry, along with
established writers, offer valuable tips and
guidance.
In a world increasingly characterised by
distractions, writing retreats have emerged as
sanctuaries where budding writers can focus,
grow, and thrive. These retreats offer a unique
blend of solitude, community, and
professional guidance, making them
appealing to anyone passionate about honing
their craft.
Writing retreats often take place in idyllic
settings, mountains, beaches, countryside
estates, away from the hustle of daily life. This
change of scenery not only inspires creativity
but also provides the peace needed to
concentrate on storytelling. Many retreats
combine workshops, one-on-one mentoring,
and group discussions, creating a
collaborative yet personal environment.
Fortunately, we have many literary retreats to
choose from, some good, others very good!
TheWriteScene’s Landour Writers’ Retreat
recently unfolded as a vibrant tapestry of
inspiration and creativity. Founded by award-
winning author Deeba Salim Irfan, this retreat
was not just a gathering of minds but a
sanctuary for writers from across India,
offering them the opportunity to refine their
craft in the tranquil surroundings that once
inspired the renowned author Ruskin Bond.
“I founded the Landour Writing Retreat to
provide aspiring writers with the support they
need to thrive. Drawing from my own
experience as a published and award-winning
author, I understand the challenges and
rewards of the writing journey. The serene
setting of Landour inspires creativity and
focus. Beyond Landour, I organise retreats in
picturesque locations like Kangra Valley,
India, Slovenia and Lapland (Northern Lights)
fostering a global community of writers. I also

curate the English and Filipino sessions of the
Tahbib Literary Festival in Dubai, a platform
for diverse voices and literary exchange,”
Deeba says with a smile and a sense of
satisfaction.
The sense of community is another powerful
draw. Writing can be a solitary endeavour,
and retreats allow participants to connect with
like-minded individuals. “Writing is a solitary
profession. You sit alone with memory and
imagination, both equal parts dangerous and
exciting. Writing retreats are a warm hand
extended in time, nudging you on, picking

you up and sometimes, putting you back on
track” says author and lawyer Sonia Chauhan.
The Landour Writing Retreat is one such
retreat. From the hosts to the sessions to the
participants, it was a motivating journey.
Sharing ideas, receiving feedback, and
networking with peers and mentors can be
incredibly motivating and lead to lifelong
creative partnerships. What participants feel is
indeed writ large on their faces, “the Landour
Writing Retreat was more than a getaway, it
was a turning point in my writing journey. I
discovered the art of truly listening to my
inner voice. The retreat’s emphasis on
discipline balanced with creativity taught me
to treat writing as both a craft and a calling.
Sessions by seasoned experts from the
publishing industry added technical depth,
knowledge, and insights into demystifying the
process of writing and publishing in India,”
says Bijetri Roy, an upcoming writer in her
own right.
Additionally, retreats often invite established
authors, editors, and publishers to guide
participants. This access to industry
professionals offers budding writers’
invaluable insights into the craft of writing
and the business of getting published.

For many budding talents, the challenge isn’t
just about writing—it’s about finding the time
and discipline to do so consistently. Writing
retreats provide structured schedules that
balance writing time with relaxation, fostering
a productive rhythm. They also encourage
writers to step out of their comfort zones,
experiment with new styles, and confront
creative blocks.
“The Landour Retreat was a perfect
combination of creativity-sparking processes,
sufficient unstructured time to allow writing
whenever one entered a flow, and quality
discussion time with a bunch of like-minded
people who write because they love to, and
who felt like long-known friends even though
we had all just met. The insights shared by
publishing industry professionals at the
Retreat were invaluable eye-openers for me,
says gratified Nilanjana, an avid reader and a
writer.
In recent years, writing retreats have gained

immense popularity, driven partly by the rise
of remote work and digital nomadism. People
now seek fulfilling, creative experiences that
go beyond their day-to-day routines.  As more
people explore writing as a career or serious
hobby, the demand for such retreats has
surged. This trend reflects a cultural shift
toward valuing personal storytelling and self-
expression. Networking at retreats is also a
valuable opportunity to build connections
that could open doors to literary agents,
publishers, and collaborative opportunities.
“India’s literary scene is a dynamic blend of
tradition and modernity, marked by its
linguistic diversity and exploration of
contemporary themes like gender, mental
health, and identity. Regional narratives and
translations are gaining prominence, while
digital platforms and self-publishing empower
emerging voices. Young writers experiment
with genres like fantasy and speculative
fiction, and women authors tackle issues of
patriarchy and empowerment. International
accolades, such as Geetanjali Shree’s Booker
Prize win, highlight India’s global literary
impact,” says Rajul, who is a well-known
mentor and editor.
Writing retreats are more than just creative
getaways; they are transformative experiences
that equip writers with the tools, confidence,
and connections needed to succeed. Whether
you’re an aspiring novelist, a poet, or a
memoirist, a writing retreat could be the
spark that ignites your literary journey.

The Allure
of Writing
Retreats

The Allure
of Writing
Retreats
Writing retreats emerge
as havens for writing
enthusiasts, offering
serene surroundings to
inspire creativity and
refine their craft

Writing retreats emerge
as havens for writing
enthusiasts, offering
serene surroundings to
inspire creativity and
refine their craft

write thing!The

Where are the bold,
thoughtful voices that
once defined Indian

literature? As commercial
pressures dominate, the
true art of writing seems

increasingly
overshadowed, writes
GYANESHWAR DAYAL
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Nestled gracefully in the foothills of
the Kumaon region in Uttarakhand,
Mukteshwar is a serene and
unspoiled retreat that has yet to
gain the limelight it truly deserves.

Perched at an elevation of 2,171 meters, this
picturesque hill station is located approximately
51 kilometers from the bustling town of
Nainital.
Mukteshwar offers you an idyllic escape for
those seeking solace amidst nature’s bounty and
a peaceful respite from the chaos of urban life. 

The Journey to Mukteshwar 

The journey to Mukteshwar is as scenic as the
destination itself. Once you cross the town

of Nainital and continue your ascent, the
winding roads begin to carve through the hills,
offering a thrilling experience of hairpin bends
and steep curves. The air grows crisper, and the
lush greenery surrounding you seems to come
alive, offering a visual treat to your senses. The
long stretches of forested hills and cascading
valleys make the drive a captivating experience,
setting the stage for the calm that awaits you. 

A Gateway to Himalayan Grandeur 

Formerly known as Muktesar, Mukteshwar
serves as a gateway to the majestic

Himalayas, providing breathtaking views of
snow-clad peaks. The Himalayan panorama
here includes the towering Nanda Devi, the
second-highest peak in India, standing tall as a
symbol of nature’s grandeur. The pristine
mountain air and serene ambiance work like a
balm, calming your soul and rejuvenating your
spirit. Mukteshwar’s unspoiled beauty makes it
an ideal destination for mindful activities such
as meditation, yoga, or simply soaking in the
peace of the surroundings. 

Mukteshwar Dham: 
A Spiritual Treat

The town derives its name from the revered
Mukteshwar Dham, an ancient temple

dedicated to Lord Shiva. Believed to be over

5,350 years old, this temple is
not only a place of worship but
also a testament to the spiritual
and historical richness of the
region. Located 21 kilometres
from the town centre, the
temple is perched atop a hill,
offering mesmerizing views of
the valley below. To reach the
temple, visitors must embark
on a short yet rewarding trek of
about 15 minutes. There are
two paths leading to the temple:
one with well-paved stairs and
another with a steep incline,
allowing visitors to choose
based on their preference and
stamina. 

Zero Point: 
A Viewpoint like No Other 

Just a short walk from the Mukteshwar Dham
lays Zero Point, a spot that offers unparalleled

views of the Himalayan range. The 10 to 15-
minute walk to this viewpoint is well worth the
effort, as the vistas that greet you are nothing
short of magical. A small entry fee of Rs. 60 is
required, but the sight of the towering peaks
bathed in golden sunlight or shrouded in misty
clouds is a reward far greater than the cost. Zero
Point allows visitors to fully immerse
themselves in the raw beauty of the mountains,
leaving an indelible mark on their hearts. 

Why Mukteshwar? 

Mukteshwar is more than just a destination,
it is an experience that soothes the mind,

body, and soul. Whether you are looking to
relax in silence, embrace the beauty of nature, or
embark on a spiritual journey, this quaint hill
station has something for everyone.  With its
charming landscapes, rich history, and spiritual
essence, Mukteshwar stands as a testament to
the timeless beauty of Uttarakhand's Kumaon
Hills. The place is a must visit if you want to
detox yourself. 

WAY TO MUKTESHWAR

THE SCENIC AND
SIMPLE MUKTESHWAR

Mukteshwar is a
quite destination
that will help you

discover your
calmer self, writes

ABHI SINGHAL

As someone who lives
for the thrill of
discovering untouched

destinations, my recent
journey to Jihar Village was a
revelation. Nestled in the
Almora district of
Uttarakhand, this unspoiled
hamlet, perched at 5,400 feet,
offers a serene escape from
the chaos of modern life. It
lies about 45 km beyond the
ever-popular Jim Corbett
National Park, yet few venture
this far—a detail that adds to
its charm. What awaited me
was a perfect blend of natural
beauty, cultural heritage, and
heartwarming simplicity.
The drive to Jihar was nothing
short of mesmerising. The
winding road was flanked by
pine forests and occasional
streams that glistened under
the sunlight. Accompanied by
lovely music in the car, I was
lost in the serenity of the
place. Two jackals darted
across the path at one point, a
reminder of the region’s rich
wildlife. As I drew closer, the
snow-capped peaks of the
Himalayas greeted me,
reaffirming that I had made
the right choice to explore
this lesser-known gem.
For accommodation, I opted
for Nivriti Summit View, a
boutique property near Basot
village. Travelling with my
family, I needed a place that
catered to both comfort and
scenic beauty, and this
property delivered on all
fronts. The first thing that
struck me upon arrival was
the sheer grandeur of the
views. On one side, the
majestic Himalayan ranges
seemed close enough to
touch, while on the other, the

endless valley stretched into a
picturesque horizon. The
sight of the Ramganga River
winding its way below added
to the allure.
The property, with its six
thoughtfully designed rooms,
was a sanctuary in itself. Each
room had large windows that
framed the surrounding
beauty like a painting. What
made the stay even more
special was the personal
touch of the owner, Randhir
Brar, whose love for travel and
nature was evident in every
corner. From curated books
to artistic décor, every detail
told a story. My mornings
began with the golden glow of
Nanda Devi, and my evenings
ended with a cup of tea as
Trisul's snowy peaks reflected
the last light of the day.
The highlight for my children
was the sprawling garden—a
perfect space to play and
unwind. For me, it was the
property’s glasshouse rooms,
which allowed me to gaze at
the stars from the comfort of
my bed. The culinary
experience was equally
memorable. While I enjoyed

their continental offerings,
the Kumaoni dishes—
prepared with fresh, local
ingredients—stole the show.
Don’t miss the chance to
savour dishes like Bhatt ki
Churdkani and Aloo ke

Gutke, prepared with
expertise.
After a full day of relaxation,
we set out the following
morning to explore Jihar. Our
first stop was the Bhona Devi
Temple, a revered shrine

nestled deep within the
forests. Located about 14 km
from Kalason Basot, the
temple is more than 250 years
old and steeped in local
legend. It houses a Shivling, a
pillar of Kaal Bhairavnath,

and the sacred hearth of
Harju Devta. The moment we
stepped into the temple
premises, a serene calmness
enveloped us, as though the
place radiated an abundance
of positive energy. However, it

wasn’t just the spiritual aura
that captivated us. The temple
offers stunning panoramic
views of the Himalayan range
and the five regions of Salt—
Talla, Malla, Vichalla, Palla,
and Valla. Its potential for
spiritual tourism is
undeniable, but its
tranquillity must be
preserved.
Next on the itinerary was a
hidden waterfall, about 25 km
from the property, towards
Almora. Accessible only on
foot, the path to the falls
remained elusive until a local
guide helped us navigate the
terrain. From the road, it
appears like a modest stream
cascading down the
mountainside, but once you
hike up, the scene transforms.
The effort was worth it. At the
top, I was greeted by a crystal-
clear pool fed by cascading
waters. Taking a dip in the
cool, pristine water felt like
nature’s own therapy.
A jungle walk leading to a
secluded spot by the
Ramganga River was another
unforgettable highlight.
Nivriti Summit View

arranged a picnic lunch for us
there, and it was nothing
short of magical. Surrounded
by the sounds of rustling
leaves and flowing water, the
experience felt like stepping
into another world. The locals
mentioned occasional
sightings of leopards, though
they assured us these majestic
creatures had never harmed
anyone—a testament to the
harmonious coexistence of
humans and wildlife here.
Evenings back at the property
were spent stargazing. The
clear skies above Jihar
unveiled the Milky Way in all
its glory, a humbling
reminder of the universe’s
vastness. It’s rare to find a
place where time slows down,
where each moment invites
introspection and wonder.
Jihar, with its unpretentious
beauty, offers precisely that.
In today’s fast-paced world,
places like Jihar remind us of
the beauty of simplicity. It’s
not just a destination; it’s an
experience—a chance to slow
down, breathe, and reconnect
with what truly matters.
Whether you’re a nature lover,
an adventure seeker, or simply
someone looking to escape
the crowds, Jihar promises
memories you’ll treasure for a
lifetime.

Escape to Peaceful Jihar
From stunning Himalayan vistas and hidden waterfalls to the charm of Nivriti

Summit View, my journey to Jihar was a perfect blend of adventure, tranquillity,
and warm hospitality, writes DIVYA BHATIA

HOW TO GET TO JIHAR
Reaching Jihar is part of the
adventure. The nearest airport is
Pantnagar, about 140 km away,
while Kathgodam railway station
is 100 km from the village. From
these points, the scenic drive to
Jihar is best enjoyed in a private
cab or local bus.

Mukteshwar promises not just a tranquil
retreat but also a journey filled with
stunning views. Whether you prefer flying,
riding a train, or driving through scenic
routes, the travel itself becomes part of the
adventure. From picturesque landscapes to
steep turns on the mountain roads, each
mode of transport offers a unique charm.
Comfortable travel options ensure that
reaching this beautiful destination is as
delightful as staying there.

Mukteshwar by Road
Mukteshwar is well-connected by road,
lying 353 km from Delhi, 51 km from
Nainital, and 42 km from Haldwani. State-
run buses link Mukteshwar with nearby
Uttarakhand cities, including Kathgodam.
Luxury buses are also available on the
Delhi-Kathgodam route, with buses
departing from Delhi's ISBT. The journey
from Delhi to Kathgodam takes about 8
hours. For those driving from Delhi, follow
NH 24 to Rampur, then NH 87 to
Ranibagh. From Ranibagh, take the state
highway to Bhowali, and finally another
state highway via Ramgarh to Mukteshwar

Mukteshwar by Train
Kathgodam Railway Station is the closest
railhead to Mukteshwar, offering
connections to major cities like Delhi,
Lucknow, and Kolkata. From Kathgodam,
travelers can hire taxis or take buses to
reach Mukteshwar conveniently.

Mukteshwar by Air
The nearest airport to Mukteshwar is
Pantnagar Airport, located 111 km away.
Another option is the Jolly Grant Airport
in Dehradun. From both airports, travelers
can hire taxis to reach Mukteshwar
comfortably.



This week holds significant promise, particularly in
financial matters. You may find yourself receiving
substantial gains early in the week. Celebrations are in
order, with joyful gatherings that underscore your recent
successes in your professional life. Happiness permeates
the home front as well, with key contributions from the
women in your life, who display remarkable health,
creativity, and energy. Their nurturing roles enhance the joy
and unity of those around them. The week may also
feature meaningful family events such as the joyous arrival
of a new family member or the initiation of a lucrative
opportunity, bringing loved ones together to share in the
collective joy. As the week closes, expect a shift in
perspective that could profoundly reshape your approach
to life, setting the stage for enduring benefits.

Lucky number 3 | Lucky colour Amber
Lucky day Tuesday

ARIES March 21-April 19

This week is heavily influenced by your emotional
and sentimental nature. You may find yourself in a
nurturing role, eager to care for those close to you.
Your compassionate demeanor makes you a source
of solace and advice for many, although this could
distract you from your professional responsibilities.
Be mindful of those around you, as there's a risk that
your straightforward approach might be exploited.
It's essential to strategize and act decisively to
ensure stability and financial security. Without active
efforts and concrete plans, mere wishful thinking
won't yield the desired results. Stay focused on your
objectives and manage your emotions effectively to
navigate through the week successfully.

Lucky number 15 | Lucky colour Crimson
Lucky day Sunday

TAURUS April 20-May 20

This week, you demonstrate a compelling sense of authority
and determination. Your strength lies not in physical prowess
but in your ability to lead and inspire others to action. Your
charismatic yet firm approach garners respect, although it
leaves little room for emotional considerations. This could
lead to some challenges in personal relationships, possibly
causing strain or even separation. Family tensions may arise,
particularly with maternal figures possibly opposing your
choices in personal partnerships, leading to disagreements.
Midweek, you might find yourself overwhelmed, struggling to
make autonomous decisions due to these pressures.
However, by week's end, you will find both financial and
emotional enrichment as a respected elder, possibly a paternal
figure, steps in to support you. Their fair and generous
actions will lay the groundwork for your future achievements.

Lucky number 7  |  Lucky colour Indigo
Lucky day Wednesday

GEMINI May 21-June 20

This week is a time for rejuvenation. Step away from the
whirlwind of your daily activities and allow yourself some
moments of relaxation. Embrace self-care by engaging in
activities that refresh both your physical and mental well-
being—consider routine health screenings, engage in
mindful exercises, take leisurely strolls, and ensure you
are getting ample rest. Such practices will equip you to
navigate the energetic pace of life that lies ahead. Your
professional life may soon pulsate with new opportunities
and potential advancements such as raises or
promotions. At home, expect to be more involved with
family duties, especially in attending to children’s needs,
which could increase your expenditures. Additionally,
consider planning a getaway that promises romantic
undertones and quality family time.

Lucky number 10 | Lucky colour Teal
Lucky day Saturday

CANCER June 21-July 22

This week, individuals born under Virgo may experience a
sense of isolation and a disconnection from everyday
activities. Challenges in personal relationships, such as a
break-up or a marital strain, could be impacting your
emotional well-being. You might also find obstacles in
your professional life; despite diligent efforts, progress
seems stalled. This period requires patience and
resilience. Stay prepared to counter any resistance you
face as this may be the final test before you achieve your
objectives. An influential figure may emerge to assist you,
providing the support needed to overcome your current
challenges. Expect a shift towards spiritual growth and a
surge of new ideas. This fresh perspective will infuse your
endeavors with innovation and a stronger sense of self-
assurance.

Lucky number 6 | Lucky colour Olive
Lucky day Saturday

VIRGO Aug 23-Sep 22

In the coming period, you may encounter situations that
test the strength of your relationships, potentially leading
to deep emotional impacts. Embrace these challenges as
they arise; they are opportunities for personal growth and
resilience. Fear of not meeting expectations or achieving
success might loom large, yet remember that true bravery
emerges from confronting and mastering these fears.
Should a new opportunity present itself, seize it with
confidence and move decisively toward your aspirations.
Let go of any reservations and clear any obstacles from
your path. If recent achievements seem less significant
than anticipated, take time to reassess and refresh your
strategies. By week's end, you could find yourself in a
more prosperous position, with increased financial
prospects or an attractive proposal coming your way.

Lucky number 1 | Lucky colour Lavender
Lucky day Wednesday

LIBRA Sep 23-Oct 22

Currently, you possess a significant intensity and strength,
which enhances your ability to understand the core of any
situation distinctly. Your sharp insights and deep
perceptiveness are at their peak, simplifying the process of
achieving your objectives. This period is optimal for
dispelling any confusion that has obscured your inner truths
and for releasing the constraints of your past that have
impeded your progress. Focus is now essential on your
aspirations, accompanied by a profound spiritual
enlightenment. Dedicate your time to harmonizing with the
natural world—engage in morning or evening walks,
embrace practices like yoga and meditation, or even
consider participating in sports at a professional level.
Embrace the flow of life's currents, allowing them to guide
you forward naturally.

Lucky number 14 | Lucky colour Coral
Lucky day Sunday

This week presents a dynamic and steady phase for you,
marked by significant authority and confidence. You find
yourself in a scenario where confronting and engaging with
influential individuals is not only possible but likely. This
period allows you to relish a surge of energy and maintain
strong connections with those around you. You may find
yourself acting as a guiding figure, providing advice, setting
goals, and fostering a sense of security for others. There's a
harmonious alignment of your physical, mental, and
emotional states, enhancing your decision-making prowess.
Your presence demands respect, as you consistently uphold
your principles, make fair judgments, and speak honestly.
Your ability to maintain a clear vision ensures that emotions
do not cloud your decisions, positioning you as a leader who
views the broader context of any situation.

Lucky number 4 | Lucky colour Fuchsia
Lucky day Sunday

AQUARIUS Jan 20-Feb 18

PISCES Feb 19-March 20

This week, you may find yourself navigating a mix of
emotions and detachment in your personal relationships.
Minor irritants could lead to disagreements, but
ultimately, decisions will be reached mutually. In your
professional life, your kindness and generosity will shine,
enhancing your reputation. Unexpected financial gains
could provide a sense of security, bolstering your ability
to handle both personal and professional challenges with
skill and efficiency. Your reliable and devoted nature will
make you a trusted figure at work. A natural curiosity will
drive your desire to acquire new knowledge, fueling your
success and making you a source of inspiration for
others. You will uphold strong ethical standards,
advocating for your beliefs and demonstrating integrity in
all your endeavors.

Lucky number 13 | Lucky colour Maroon
Lucky day Friday

CAPRICORN Dec 22-Jan 19

LEO July 23-Aug 22 

This week, you'll find yourself feeling invigorated and full of
life, ready to tackle any obstacles that come your way. There's
a sense of cosmic alignment that seems to enhance your
efforts, steering you towards successful outcomes. Your
energy is well-placed, boosting areas of your life that need the
most attention. With a clear vision and unwavering resolve,
you're set to conquer your highest aspirations. At home, the
atmosphere buzzes with the promise of significant events that
bring joy and fulfillment. A deep-seated wish of yours may
finally come to fruition, possibly linked to family growth or
children's achievements, which might include academic
successes or securing opportunities they've eagerly sought.
Your belief in your abilities and a higher power greatly shapes
your reality, fostering a positive environment that encourages
you to achieve remarkable things.

Lucky number 5 | Lucky colour Turquoise
Lucky day Monday

SAGITTARIUS Nov 22-Dec 21

YOUR
WEEK
AHEAD

MADHU KOTIYA
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Individuals born under this sign possess boundless
potential, enabling them to transform and craft their reality
as they see fit. While it is not feasible for everyone to
uncover every mystery, these individuals often lead others
to explore and tap into their own depths to unveil untapped
capabilities. Known for their deep spiritual focus, they wield
considerable power to enrich and fundamentally change
lives. They adhere to a strong belief in balance and fairness,
understanding that every action triggers a corresponding
reaction, echoing the principles of cause and effect. To
cultivate positive outcomes, they maintain a mindset geared
toward making decisions that align with their desired
results. This clarity of thought facilitates the full realization
of their goals and alleviates many of life’s challenges.
Anticipate a significant journey or change in the near future.

Lucky number 17 | Lucky colour Purple
Lucky day Friday

SCORPIO Oct 23-Nov 21

This week calls for measured actions and a calm
demeanor. Embracing moderation rather than giving in
to impulsive reactions will serve you well. Opportunities
that could significantly improve your circumstances may
arise, yet there's a risk of undermining these prospects
through unchecked pride or a dismissive attitude. While
self-respect is crucial, maintaining a balance with how
others perceive you is equally important. You might find
that new beginnings in your endeavors could stir envy
among competitors. Stay vigilant as you could become
the target of negative intentions. It’s wise to be
observant and understand the motivations of those
around you. Secure your valuable possessions and keep
a close eye on those who have access to your personal
space or property.

Lucky number 9 | Lucky colour Magenta
Lucky day Thursday

Now yyou ccan wwrite tto uus aat agendapioneer@gmail.com

‘Cogito, ergo sum’ ... I
Think therefore I am. ...
René Descartes

If you have decided to read this.
Stop. Think what you are
thinking now. Because …
Whether you think you can or
you think you can’t, you’re right!
The only thing absolutely in our
power is our Thought. 
It shapes our reality. Influences
our emotions. Translates to
actions. And ultimately defines
the quality of our lives. This
concept is deeply embedded in
various philosophical and
spiritual traditions, including
ancient Indian wisdom,
emphasizing the profound
impact of our mental processes,
manifesting into our
experiences.
In the realm of Vedic philosophy,
the Nature of thoughts is not just
merely a fleeting phenomenon.
They are powerful forces that can
create or destroy. The idea that
“you become what you think”
resonates with many ancient
texts, highlighting the
significance of cultivating positive
thoughts.

“;Fkk ladYirseu%rnuqlEi|rs”
“As the mind thinks, so it
becomes.”

The quality of our thoughts
directly influences our reality. A
positive mindsetattracts positive
experiences.
Positive Thinkingis not merely
wishful thinking. It is a conscious
effort to reshape our cognitive
patterns. This idea is echoed in
various scriptures that advocate
for a mindset centred on
optimism and well-being.

“vlrksekln~xe;”
“Lead me from the unreal to the
real.”

This shloka from the
Brihadaranyaka Upanishad
encourages individuals to move
from ignorance to knowledge. By
focusing on positive and truthful
thoughts, we navigate through the
complexities of life towards clarity
peace and Holistic wellbeing. 
A thought is energy.Almost
impossible to stop from flowing
in. Having a sizeable impact effect
on every facet of our life. What
however is possible and should be
the goal is to regulate them
conscientiously so as to have
them supportively influence and
nourish our present moment.
How we nurture out thoughts is
in our control. Thereby we can
manage how they impact us. If we

allow the negative to nest within
for a long period, we create a
cyclic trap which is detrimental. 
It is important to emphasize here
that when we stay on and
nourishthoughts, we become
what we think. Yet … we must
recognise that and understand
that we are not our thoughts. We

have the ability to rise above
them. 
Meditation and mindfulness
practices are vital in harnessing
the power of our thoughts. They
help in cultivatingconsciousness,
allowing us to observe our
thoughts without attachment.
This detachment is crucial in

understanding the transient
nature of thoughts.
“'kkUrkdkjaHkqtx'k;uai'kqifra;ksfxuke~”
“Peaceful in form, resting on a
serpent, Lord of all beings, O
yogis...”

This shloka refers to Lord Shiva,
symbolising inner peace and

mastery over the mind. Through
practices that promote
mindfulness, we can align our
thoughts with tranquillity and
purpose.
The power of thoughts extends
beyond the individual. It
influences our ecosystem. The
teachings of the Upanishads
highlight the interconnectedness
of life and the importance of
collective positivity.
The power of our thoughts is a
profound truth recognised in
ancient Indian philosophy. By
cultivating positive, constructive
thoughts, we can transform our
reality, contribute to our well-
being, and enhance our
connections with ourself, others
and the Universe. As we navigate
through life’s challenges, our
thoughts hold the key to our
experiences, shaping our destinies
with each conscious choice we
make.
As Raman Maharishi said - The
degree of freedom from unwanted
thoughts and the degree of
concentration on a single thought
are the measures to gauge
spiritual progress. We are the seat
of limitless Power - through our
thought. Just One Thought can
make all the difference!! I Think
therefore I am.

The Power of a Thought

Thoughts shape
reality; regulate them

to transform your
destiny.
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